

**RESOLUTION 12-331**

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of Decatur, Morgan County, in the State of Alabama, that it appearing the bid of EA Nelson Co. Inc., having been the lowest and best bid for furnishing and delivering Two (2) 17' Finishing Mowers for the Parks & Recreation Department, in accordance with specifications provided, and from evidence submitted it appearing that such vendor is qualified and able to fulfill the requirements of the specifications, said bid is hereby adopted and the Purchasing Agent is authorized to issue a Purchase Order to said bidder in the amount of \$27,518.00.

Adopted this 1<sup>st</sup> day of October, 2012

### Bid Tabulation

12-031 17' Finishing Mower -- September 10th, 2012 11:00AM

Bidder	Make/Model	\$ Each	Qty	Total Bid
<b>Bel- Air Turf Products, LLC.</b>	Befco, Inc.	\$16,788.00	1	\$16,788.00
Leeds, AL 35094	417-SFLA	\$16,288.00	2	\$32,576.00
<b>EA Nelson Company, Inc.</b>	Rhino	\$14,594.00	1	\$14,594.00
Florence AL 35630	TX 1700	\$13,759.00	2	\$27,518.00
<b>Golf Ventures, Inc.</b>	Jacobsen	\$72,430.00	1	\$72,430.00
Pelham AL 35124	70539 9016	\$72,430.00	2	\$144,860.00
<b>Humphries Turf Supply</b>	Bushhog	\$17,598.49	1	\$17,598.49
Joppa AL 35087	TD 1700 (See Spec Sheet for Exception)	\$17,298.79	2	\$34,597.58
<b>Huntsville Tractor &amp; Equipment, Inc.</b>	Woods	\$14,522.00	1	\$14,522.00
Huntsville AL 35814	TBW 204	\$14,522.00	2	\$29,044.00
<b>Huntsville Tractor &amp; Equipment, Inc.</b>	Landpride	\$13,727.00	1	\$13,727.00
Huntsville AL 35814	Amf 4216-1531	\$13,727.00	2	\$27,454.00
<b>Jerry Pate Turf &amp; Irrigation</b>	-----	NO BID	1	NO BID
Pensacola FL 32504			2	
<b>Thompson</b>	-----	NO BID	1	NO BID
Huntsville AL 35805			2	

Low Bidder

\*See Below

Persuant to Section 41-16-24 of the Code of Alabama, the following bidders requested notification, but did not respond:

**Bidders:**

**Address:**

Dobbs Equipment Company, Ins.	1621 Creighton Avenue SE Decatur, AL 35601
Fredricks Equipment, Inc.	1312 South Bethel Road Decatur, AL 35603
H & R Agris-Power	7809 US Hwy 31 S Tanner, AL 35671
Haney Equipment Company	PO Box 1037, 1702 HWY 72 E Athens, AL 35612
John Deere Landscapes	4630 Commercial Drive Huntsville, AL 35816
Peddler II	1308 Fairway Drive SE Decatur, AL 35601
Precision Husky Corporation	PO Drawer 507 Leeds, AL 35094
Trigree Equipment	131 US Hwy 31 S Athens, AL 35611

**\*Low Bidder Exceptions to Specifications:**

<u>City Requirement</u>	<u>Quoted</u>
17' Cutting Width	16' Cutting Width
Rated to 80HP	Rated to 70HP