Agenda
City of Winter Haven Planning Commission Meeting
April 6, 2010, 7:00 pm
John Fuller Auditorium - City Hall
451 Third Street, NW, Winter Haven, Florida

1. Call to Order and Roll Call

2. Invocation and Pledge of Allegiance
3. Approval of March 2, 2010 Minutes

4. New Business
A. Case Number P-10-15: Administrative request to amend Chapter 5 of the

Winter Haven Code of Ordinances by adopting the International Property Maintenance
Code.

5. Election of Officers for 2010

6. Comments from Staff
7. Comments from Planning Commissioners
8. Adjournment

All interested parties who decide to appeal any decision made by the Commission, Board, or Agency with
respect to the matter considered at such meeting or hearing will need a record of the proceedings, and
that, for such purpose, may need to ensure that a verbatim record of the proceedings is made, which
record includes the testimony and evidence upon which the appeal is to be based (F.S. 286.0105).
Please be advised that you must make your own arrangements to produce this record. The Planning
Division may be reached at (863) 291-5600, or at City Hall, 451 Third Street, NW, Winter Haven,
Florida, 33881. In accordance with the Americans with Disabilities Act and Florida Statutes, Section
286.26, persons with disabilities needing special accommodations to participate in this proceeding,
should contact the City Clerk’s Office, 451 Third Street, NW, Winter Haven Florida 33881, in writing, no
later than 48 hours prior to the proceeding; if not in writing, then not later than four (4) days prior to the
proceeding at (863) 291-5600. Vision or hearing impaired please call (800) 955-8771 for assistance.



CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
PLANNING COMMISSION MEETING MINUTES
March 2, 2010
CALL TO ORDER
Chairman Joiner called the meeting to order at 7:02 p.m.
INVOCATION

Invocation was offered by Chairman Joiner.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Pledge of Allegiance was led by Chairman Joiner.
ROLL CALL
Commissioners Present:

Jim Joiner (Chair), Tess Dull (Vice-Chair), George Horvath, Steve Lockhart, Fred
Putney, Charles Smith, April Spencer and City Commissioner J.P. Powell,
Planning Commission Liaison.

Commissioners Absent:

Kenneth Grant, Lauren Oakley, and Pam Luce, Ex-Officio.
Staff Present:

David Dickey, Community Development Director, John Murphy, City Attorney,
Sean Byers, Senior Planner, Jeanne Sobierajski, Planner II.

Public Present:
13 citizens were in attendance.

MINUTES

Motion was made by Commissioner Horvath for approval of the January 5,
2010, Planning Commission Meeting Minutes. Commissioner Dull
seconded the motion. Motion carried unanimously.

OLD BUSINESS

Case Numbers P-10-08 and P-10-09: Request by Jack M. Berry, Inc. to
amend the Future Land Use on two (2) parcels located on the southwest corner
of Pollard Road and Eloise Loop/Eagle Lake Loop Road from Residential-
Medium Density to Commercial-Retail. The area covered by this request is 13+
acres, and to re-zone six (6) parcels generally located on the southwest corner
of Pollard Road and Eloise Loop/Eagle Lake Loop Road from Multi-family



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

Residential (R-3) zoning district to Planned Unit Development (PUD) zoning
district. The area covered by this request is 67+ acres

Sean Byers, Senior Planner, gave an overview of the request, showed via a slideshow
presentation, the property involved in the request and surrounding areas, and indicated
that staff recommends approval of thi:: request. Nir. Byers stated for the record that all
notification requirements have been met.

BACKGROUND:

Jack M. Berry, Inc., petitioner, requests that the City amend the Future Land Use on two
(2) parcels totaling 13+ acres from Residential-Medium Density to Commercial-Retail,
and to re-zone six (6) parcels totaling 67+ acres from Multi-family Residential (R-3)
zoning district to Planned Unit Development (PUD) zoning district. The parcels are
utilized as citrus groves, outside equipment storage, and are divided by CSX railroad
tracks.

The petitioner is proposing to develop the property with up to 540 muiti-family units and
200,000 square feet of self storage units located within a single, two to three story
building. The self storage units are proposed for the 13-acre portion of the property
lying between Pollard Road and the railroad tracks; the muiti-family units are planned
for the 54-acre portion of the property located west of the railroad tracks. Construction
of the project will be phased and will not likely start until late 2010 or early 2011.
Access to the development will be from Eagle Lake Loop Road and Pollard Road.

Amendment of the 13% acres from Residential-Medium Future Land Use to
Commercial-Retail Future Land Use will reduce the maximum number of potential units
from 670 to 540 and will allow up to 311,454 (13 x 43,560 x 0.55) square feet of
commercial space. To address roadway capacity concerns on Eloise Loop/Eagle Lake
Loop Road, staff proposes to add Policy 1.4.9 to the Future Land Use Element I|m|t|ng
the commercial area to 200,000 square feet.

This request was originally heard and approved by the Planning Commission at its
January 5, 2010, meeting; however, upon the applicant’'s further communication with
neighboring property owners, significant design changes have been made. The most
significant changes are to increase the square footage of the personal storage units
from 116,500 to 200,000, housing the storage units into a single building, and
increasing the residential building setbacks from the railroad tracks from 30 feet to 50
feet.

As this request involves more than 10 acres, it will be required to be transmitted to the
Florida Department of Community Affairs (DCA) for review. Transmittal of this item to
DCA is expected to occur in March, 2010.

SURROUNDING USES:

Uses surrounding the subject parcel are described by the following table:



Planning Commission Meeting

March 2, 2010

North
Singb_F:;;’;“g:;tdential ¢ | Single-Family Residential, Mobile Northeast
Outside Storage Homes, Light Ifg:jtnal, & Vacant Single-Family Residential
Woest Subject Property East
Single-Family Residential Citrus Groves & Equipment Storage Vacant Land
Southwest South
Single-Family Residential & Pasture Land & Single-Family \?Vougllea:t
Woodlands Residential oodlands
COMPREHENSIVE PLAN:

The current Future Land Use for the parcels is Residential-Medium. The requested
Future Land Use on the easternmost 13+ acres is Commercial-Retail. Both land uses
are described below.

Policy 1.3.1:

Policy 1.4.1:

Residential classifications are hereby established on the Future Land
Use Map, in accordance with the following classifications and gross
densities:

(b.) Residential-Medium (RM) = 4.01 to 10.0 dwelling units per acre

Commercial classifications are established and shown on the Future
Land Use Map, in accordance with the following classifications and
development density/intensity standards. Activity center overlay
classifications are established to set forth development standards
which supplement the requirements of the commercial land-use
classification.

(b.) Commercial-Retail Areas mapped “Commercial-Retail” allow retail
sales, services, offices, storage and related commercial activities
at the following intensity standards:

Lot Coverage (Max.) = 80%
Floor Area Ratio shall be as follows:
Parcels less than one (1) acre in size = .75

Parcels between one (1) acre and ten (10) acres in area = .65
Parcels greater than ten (10) acres in area = .55

Amending the Future Land Use on the 13-acre triangular shaped property will allow for
more compatible uses given the close proximity to Eagle Lake Loop Road and the
railroad tracks. The proposed personal storage units will be a low-impact use and will
serve to buffer the existing industrial uses and the railroad tracks from residential uses
located to the north and east.



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

UNIFIED LAND DEVELOPMENT CODE:

The requested PUD zoning district is consistent with the existing Residential-Medium
Density Future Land Use and the requested Commercial-Retail Future Land Use
designations. Additionally, re-zoning the property to a PUD will allow site specific
development conditions to be placed on the property to improve aesthetics,
compatibility, and surrounding infrastructure.

UTILITIES:

Development of up to 540 multi-family residential units and up to 200,000 square feet of
commercial space may generate up to 214,698 (540 x 2.1 x 147 + 200,000 x 0.24)
gallons of potable water and 189,660 (540 x 2.1 x 147 + 200,000 x 0.24 x 0.88) gallons
of wastewater demands daily. This represents an increase of 7,869 gallons of potable
water and 6,750 gallons of wastewater treatment capacity from the demands generated
by the maximum development permitted under the current adopted Future Land Use.
Any use that locates on this site shall be required to meet water and wastewater
concurrency standards at the time of building permit issuance. Additionally, any future
development will be required to connect to reuse water upon its availability.

TRANSPORTATION:

Access to the property is from Eloise Loop/Eagle Lake Loop Road or Pollard Road.
Eloise Loop/Eagle Lake Loop Road is a two-lane, County-maintained collector roadway
and Pollard Road is a two-lane, County-maintained, local street. Based on
development of up to 540 multi-family units and 200,000 square feet of commercial
space, up to 1,367 peak-hour trips may be generated. This represents an increase of
1,019 trips over the number of trips that may be generated by the current Future Land
Use and zoning designations; however, it must be noted that development of 540 multi-
family units and 200,000 square feet of personal storage units will likely result in 333
peak-hour trips, a reduction of 15 peak-hour trips from the currently approved R-3
zoning. A breakdown of Eloise Loop Road and Eagle Lake Loop Road is below.

Current | Previously | Total
Roadway | et | Peakcour| Commitied | k- | o peak. | Peactour | Now LOS
(2009) Trips | Trips |HourTrips|  Trips
E’é’ﬁ%"“p c 465 266 731 807 1,538 F
Cowe Loop c 675 153 828 0 828 E
Egg:)e;jkEeB c 356 0 356 0 356 c
Esgée;:’\‘zla C 516 153 669 560 1,229 F

Eloise Loop Road Capacity = 760 (LOS D); Eagle Lake Loop Road Capacity = 760 (LOS D) |

In 2009, the Florida Legislature passed Senate Bill 360 which provided for exemptions
to transportation concurrency in dense urban areas. In July 2009, Winter Haven

4



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

In 2009, the Florida Legislature passed Senate Bill 360 which provided for exemptions
to transportation concurrency in dense urban areas. In July 2009, Winter Haven
qualified as a dense urban area, and now qualifies as a Transportation Concurrency
Exception Area (TCEA). Additionally, construction to expand Eloise Loop
Road/Thompson Nursery Road to four lanes is expected to begin in 2013/2014.

SCHOOLS:

This request reduces the potential number of residential units that could be developed
on the property by 130. The Polk County School Board typically supports requests that
do not result in an increased demand on public schools.

NOTIFICATION:

All public notification requirements for these requests have been met.

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends the Planning Commission recommend approval of these requests
subject to the following PUD conditions:

1. All uses shall be limited to a maximum of 540 multi-family residential units and up
to 200,000 square feet of personal storage units (mini-warehouses). Outdoor
storage shall be limited to the southern portion of the commercial area.

2. Minimum setbacks for the muiti-family units shall be as follows:

Apartment/Condominium Units

Project
Perimeter: 20 feet
Building
Separation: 15 feet
Railroad
Tracks: 50 feet

Townhouse Lots

Front: 20 feet
Side: 0 feet
Rear: 20 feet
Building

Separation: 15 feet
Railroad

Tracks: 50 feet

3. The minimum living area for residential units shall be 600 square feet.



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

4.

10.

11.

12.

Minimum setbacks for the personal storage units shall be as follows:

Front: 25 feet
Street

Side: 15 feet
Railroad .
Tracks: 15 feet

Maximum building height shall not exceed 45 feet.

Residential landscaping. A minimum 10-foot type “C” landscape buffer shall be
installed between the multi-family residential and Eagle Lake Loop Road. A
minimum 10-foot type “F” landscape buffer with a 6-foot, opaque, fence or wall
shall be installed between the multi-family residential and the western property
line. A minimum 10-foot type “C” landscape buffer shall be installed between the
multi-family residential and the southern property line. A 25-foot type “G”
landscape buffer with an 8-foot, opaque, fence or wall shall be installed between
the multi-family residential and the adjacent railroad tracks. A 10-foot type “E”
landscape buffer with a 6-foot, opaque, fence shall be installed between the
multi-family residential and the light industrial uses to the north.

Personal storage units area landscaping. A minimum 10-foot type “E” landscape
buffer without a 6-foot opaque fence or wall, based on the width of the buffer,
shall be installed between the personal storage units and Eagle Lake Loop Road
and Pollard Road.

The developer shall dedicate additional right-of-way to allow for 40 feet to the
centerline of Eagle Lake Loop Road and 40 feet to the centerline of Pollard
Road.

A 6-foot sidewalk shall be installed along the development’s frontages with Eagle
Lake Loop Road and Pollard Road. Additionally, a six (6) foot sidewalk shall
connect the residential development to the sidewalk on Eagle Lake Loop Road.

The main entrance drive from Eagle Lake Loop Road into the development shall
contain a minimum 12-foot wide median. The median shall have a Type “F” curb
and gutter. Additionally, within the median, one (1) overstory or two (2)
understory tree(s) shall be planted every 100 linear feet or fraction thereof. A
minimum of fifty percent (50%) of the medians’ groundcover must be of a living
groundcover other than grass.

A minimum of two (2) rain gardens, with native plantings, shall be located within
the development. The location and size of the gardens shall be approved by the
Planning Division.

The fagades of the building fronting Eagle Lake Loop Road and Pollard Road
shall be designed in such a way as to appear to have a roof structure and



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

windows. Elevations for these buildings shall be submitted for approval to the
Planning Division as part of the site plan review process.

13. Signage for the multi-family residential development shall be limited to a
monument sign not to exceed six (6) feet in height and 32 square feet in area.
Signage for the personal storage units shall be limited to a monument sign
located on Eagle Lake Loop Road not exceeding eight (8) feet in height and 96
square feet in area and a secondary monument sign on Pollard Road not
exceeding six (6) feet in height and 48 square feet in area.

14. Al exterior lighting fixtures shall be designed to focus light away from
neighboring properties. Building mounted lights shall utilize light shields or other
features to prevent glare. Pole mounted lights shall utilize cut-off luminare type
fixtures. ‘

15.  All development shall be in general conformance with the attached site plan.

16.  All other code requirements shall apply.
Chairman Joiner closed the Planning Commission and opened the public hearing.

Jean Reed, 27 Lake Eloise Lane, Winter Haven, Florida, was sworn in and spoke in
favor of the project. She inquired as to the use of the one-story buildings on the west
and south side and the effect on the residential buildings upon construction of the
Thompson Nursery Road realignment road.

Eric Labbe, Director of Strategic Planning for Jack Berry Inc, 815 S. New York Avenue,
Lakeland, Florida, was sworn in. Mr. Labbe advised that the one story buildings were
also self-storage buildings. They were designed to secure and shield the outside
storage located in the middle of the complex. The purpose was to act as a buffer to
conceal boats and RV's that may be stored there. Regarding the realignment of
Thompson Nursery Road, he stated that plans for the multi-family portion of the project
are going ahead assuming that the road realignment will not take place. Should the
realignment happen, the property will likely be vacant land still and can be reconsidered
at that time.

Chairman Joiner closed the public hearing and re-opened the Planning Commission
meeting.

Commissioner Lockhart moved to recommend approval of Case Numbers P-10-08
and P-10-09 subject to the conditions recommended by staff. Commissioner
Horvath seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously by a roll call
vote.

7. New Business

A. Case Number P-10-13: Administrative request to assign Industrial with a
Business Park Center overlay and Conservation Future Land Uses to eight (8) annexed

7



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

parcels. The parcels are generally located west of the CSX Railroad tracks,
approximately 1,300 feet north of Old Bartow/Lake Wales Road. The area covered by
this request is 932+ acres

Jeanne Sobierajski, Planner Il, gave an cverview of the request and indicated that staff
recommends approval of this request. Ms. Sobierajski stated for the record that all
notification requirements have been met.

BACKGROUND:

Staff requests that the City assign Industrial with a Business Park Center averlay and
Conservation Future Land Uses to City-owned property located west of the CSX
Railroad tracks, approximately 1,300 feet north of Old Bartow/Lake Wales Road. The
area contains 932+ acres and consists of woodlands and the abandoned overland flow
portion of Wastewater Treatment Plant 3.

Since the mid 1970’s, the City utilized approximately 1,700 acres of land as part of the
Wastewater Treatment Plant 3 operations. In 2007, the City converted WWTP 3 from
an overland flow system to an advanced wastewater treatment facility, which drastically
reduced the amount of acreage needed for the operations. As a result, approximately
1,250 acres became available for uses other than wastewater operations. Due to the
geographic central location of the property in the State, close proximity to state
roadways, and over 12,000 linear feet of undeveloped frontage along a main CSX rail
line, CSX Corporation entered into an agreement with the City for the purchase of the
1,250 acres of land for the construction of an Intermodal Facility and ancillary uses. In
2007, Evansville Western Railway closed on 318 of the 1,250 acres for the development
of an Intermodal Facility. In October, 2008, the Evansville Western Railway, Inc.
Development of Regional Impact (DRI) was approved for the Intermodal.

Since the annexation of the property in 2006,‘ the property has maintained its county
land use designation of Institutional-2. The table below provides a breakdown of the
current and proposed Future Land Use assignments for the 932 acres.

Current Polk County Future | Acres Proposed City - Acres
Land Use Future Land Use

Institutional-2 932+ Conservation 16+

Business Park Center - 904+

Pollard Road Extension 12+

Total 932+ Total 932+

The current Future Land Use designation of Polk County Institutional-2 allows for the
development of up to 28,442,938 square feet of building area on the 932+ acres.

For purposes of concurrency, the analysis assumes that within the first five years up to

30,000 square feet of office, 50,000 square feet of light industrial, and 500,000 square
feet of warehouse uses will be constructed on the property. The balance of the property

8



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

will be built out over the next 20 years. To formalize this assumption, Policy 1.4.9 to the
Future Land Use Element is being proposed to limit development to the following:

Type of Use Square footage Floor Area Ratio
5 years / 20 years
Office 30,000 / 500,000 0.21
Light Industrial 50,000/ 2,200,000 0.20
Warehouse Distribution 500,000 / 5,200,000 0.20
Total 580,000/ 7,900,000

Since this request involves more than 10 acres, it will be transmitted to the Florida
Department of Community Affairs (DCA) for review.

The Central Florida Regional Planning Council (CFRPC) has reviewed the application
and its comments have been incorporated where appropriate.

SURROUNDING USES:

Uses surrounding the subject property are described by the following table:

Northwest North Northeast
Vacant land Wastewater Treatment Plant 3 Woodlands and pasture land
West Subject Property , East
Residential Woodlands, spray fields, and Woodlands, spray fields, and
Florida Power Transmission residential
Lines
Southwest South Southeast
Pasture land & Single-Family Woodlands and pasture land Woodiands
Residential
NEEDS ANALYSIS:

Supply:

This amendment serves to increase availability of large tracts of industrial land that are
accessed by State Road 60, which is part of the State Strategic Intermodal System
(SIS) network, and are adjacent to the Intermodal. In addition, the parcels will provide
important employment centers for the City.

The City of Winter Haven currently has 740.38 acres of undeveloped land on fifteen
parcels designated as Business Park Center. The total upland area reduces the
developable acreage to 646.98 acres.

Of the fifteen parcels, only five (5) are over ten acres in size and only two (2) are over
25 acres in size. According to the Urban Land Institutes “Business Park and Industrial
Development Handbook” the minimum size needed to support a business or industrial
park is 25 to 100 acres. Therefore, there are only two (2) sites that meet the
requirements to provide a master planned business or industrial park, one being 28.8

9



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

acres located on State Road 544 and the other being the Stokes Busmess Park
containing 550 acres located on State Road 60.

Demand:

A comparison of 13 Integrated Logistics Ceniers (ILC) from around the country revealed
that the average size is 3,072 acres. The proposed ILC, aiung with the adjacent Stokes
Business Park, will total 1,466 acres.

With the construction of the Intermodal, land uses that complement and support its
operation will be essential. The Intermodal along with the ILC will be a centralized
transportation hub, logistics and goods distribution center. The fundamental purpose of
the facility is to transfer goods from rail to truck and from truck to rail. The Intermodal
will generate a need for support services in close proximity to the facility. The ILC lands
that surround the Intermodal will service this need.

The supply analysis shows the lack of available large parcels in the City, and the
proposed plan amendment will provide additional parcels over 25 acres in size. The
location of the ILC serves to fill the gap between the Intermodal and the Stokes
Business Park. ,

The demand comparison analysis shows that the average size of a similar facility is
3,072 acres; therefore, providing 904 acres of Business Park Center for the long range
planning period is proportionate to this need.

UTILITIES:

City water and sewer lines are located adjacent to the subject area. The Winter Haven
Water System provides a maximum capacity of 12.325 million gallons daily (mgd) for
use throughout the City. Wastewater will be treated at Wastewater Treatment Plant 3,
which has a current capacity of 7.5 mgd. The tables below indicate prolected daily
water and sewer demands for this property based on the maximum build-out in five
years and twenty years.

5-Year Build-out

Use Intensity Formula Water Formula Sewer

Demand Demand

(gallons) ' (gallons)

Office 30,000 sf 0.24 7,200 | 0.24x0.88 | 6,336

Light 50,000 sf (100 15 1,500 | 0.88 1,320
Industrial employees)

Warehouse | 500,000 (500 15 7,500 | 0.88 6,600
employees)

Total 16,200 14,256

10




Pianning Commission Meeting

March 2, 2010

Capacity Average Committed Capacity Remaining
(gallons) Demand Capacity Required to Capacity
(gallons) Serve this
Request
(gallons)
Water 12,325,000 | 9,473,000 | 1,225,821. 16,200 1,609,979
| Sewer 7,500,000 3,600,000 621,052 14,256 3,264,692
(WWTP#3)
20-Year Build-out
Use Intensity Formula Water Formula Sewer
Demand Demand
(gallons) (gallons)
Office 500,000 sf 0.24 120,000 | 0.24 x 0.88 | 105,600
Light 2,200,000 sf (4,400 15 66,000 | 0.88 58,080
Industrial employees)
Warehouse | 5,200,000 (5,200 16 78,000 | 0.88 68,640
employees)
Total 264,000 232,320
Capacity Average Committed Capacity Remaining
(gallons) Demand Capacity Required to Capacity
(gallons) Serve this
Request
(gallons)
Water 12,325,000 | 9,473,000 | 1,225,821 264,000 1,362,179
Sewer 7,500,000 3,600,000 621,052 232,320 3,046,628
(WWTP#3)

The City has water and wastewater capacity to serve this development, both in the 5
and 20 year planning timeframe. Any use that locates on this site shall be required to
meet water and wastewater concurrency standards at the time of building permit
issuance. Additionally, all development within this area will be required to connect to
the City’s reuse system.

TRANSPORTATION:

Access to the property will be from the Pollard Road extension to State Road 60.
State Road 60 is a four-lane, State maintained, divided, arterial roadway and Pollard
Road (to begin construction in 2010) is designed as a two-lane, City-maintained,
roadway. The tables below provide a breakdown of projected transportation demands
on the surrounding roadway network based on maximum build-out in five years and

twenty years.

11




Planning Commission Meeting

March 2, 2010

5-Year Build-out

Proposed Use Intensity Formula Projected New
Peak-Hour Trips
Office 30,000 sf X .00177 53
Light Industrial * | 50,000 sf X .00086 43
Warehouse 500,000 sf X .00086 430
Total 526
Roadway Current | Current | Proposed | Previously Proposed Proposed Peak-Hour
Peak- Level New Committed | Total Peak- | Level of :Capacity
Hour of Peak- Peak-Hour Hour Trips Service (LOS C)
Trips | Service Hour Trips
Trips
SR60 EB 905 B 235 0 1,140 B 1,730
SR60 WB 1,119 B 2091 0 1,410 B 1,730
20-Year Build-out
Proposed Use Intensity Formula Projected New
Peak-Hour Trips
Office 500,000 sf X.00177 885
Light Industrial | 2,200,000 sf X .00086 1,720
Warehouse 5,200,000 X .00086 4,472
Total 7,077
Roadway Current ;| Current | Proposed | Previously Proposed | Proposed i’eak-Hour
Peak- Level New Committed | Total Peak- | Level of -Capacity
Hour of Peak- Peak-Hour Hour Trips Service (LOS C)
Trips | Service Hour Trips
Trips
SR60 EB 905 B 3,163 0 4,068 F 1,730
SR60 WB 1,119 B 3,914 0 5,033 F - 1,730

WilsonMiller has prepared a traffic analysis for the 5-year development program as well
as a long term transportation analysis for the proposed project (see Planning Report).
In summary, the analysis indicates that no transportation improvements will be needed
within the first 5 years. This is in part due to the amount of development occurring in
that timeframe, as well as the capacity of impacted roads. As discussed earlier in this
report, the square footage will not exceed 580,000 square feet over the firstifive years.
A number of transportation improvements will be needed over the build-out of the
project (see Planning Report).

The Polk Transportation Planning Organization (TPO) has identified nearby projects in
the 2030 Long Range Plan that should provide additional capacity to serve long-term
development of the property. These projects include: Central Polk Parkway, Pollard
Road Extension, Central Polk East/West Collector Road, and Bartow Northern

Connector.

12




Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

The City of Winter Haven is designated as a Dense Urban Land Area (DULA) per
requirements set forth in SB 360 (2009). Development within a DULA community is
exempt from the requirements of the Development of Regional Impact (DRI) process.
The City as a DULA will be required to prepare a Transportation Concurrency
Exemption Area (TCEA) study to show how transportation mobility will be achieved in
the future. In order to do this the City will work with the Polk Transportation Planning
Organization," other local governments, the Central Florida Regional Council, and the
Florida Department of Transportation to ensure future transportation mobility will be
continued.

ENERGY EFFICIENCY:

New requirements of Chapter 2008-191, Laws of Florida require that the Future Land
Use Element must include greenhouse gas reduction strategies. This plan amendment
supports the reduction of greenhouse gases by supporting and promoting the use of rail
for the movement of freight. Operations in the proposed ILC will be integral to the
operations of the adjacent Intermodal. Goods will be transported via rail from the
Intermodal to the warehouse distribution and light industrial operations within the ILC.
Goods may then be transferred to trucks for local distribution, or processed in a light
industrial operation for local distribution or transferred out via rail.

It is anticipated that there will be a reduction in the use of imported oil and the emissions
of greenhouse gases through the use of rail based on the following:

e The rail industry continually strives to reduce the amount of carbon dioxide
emitted into the environment. According to CSX, since 1980, the railroad industry
has improved locomotive fuel efficiency by over 80%. This equates to 3.3 billion
gallons less of diesel fuel and 37 million fewer tons of carbon dioxide over a 26
year period had their fuel efficiency remained the same.’

» When compared to trucks, rail operations reduce fuel consumption and improve
the quality of air. The Federal Railroad Administration of the U.S. Department of
Transportation summarizes the increased efficiency of rail over truck, even for
relatively short haul trips (of less than 100 miles): “Railroads are fuel efficient,
requiring less energy to move each passenger or ton of freight than virtually any
other mode . . . . for routes less than 100 miles, comparing regional/local rail and
truck service, trucks used from 4.03 to 9.00 times more fuel than rail.”> Both
truck and rail primarily use diesel engines to power these modes, and so energy
use and greenhouse gas emissions are similarly less for rail-related goods
transport than for the truck-road system. A similar gain in energy efficiency, and a
corresponding lowering in greenhouse gas emissions, could reasonably be
anticipated for movement of goods via rail. This improved efficiency, where it can
be captured by rail systems is an important opportunity that the proposed
amendment can facilitate.

' CSX Rail statistics from CSX website: http://www.csx.com
2 FRA Energy Web Page http://www.fra.dot.gov/us/content/977

13



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

« By providing for the convenient distribution of goods from more flexible centers
that are close to consumers, the amount of fuel used by trucks or rail to get the
goods to the consumer is reduced. :

NATURAL RESOURCES:

Breedlove, Dennis & Associates has prepared an Environmental Assessment Report
(see Planning Report) for the 932+ acres. In summary, the site consists of relatively flat
topography originally vegetated by pine flatwoods. The property is interspersed with
forested wetlands and marshes connecting to the Peace Creek Marsh. The Marsh and
wetlands have been significantly impacted by ditching and regional drainage projects.

Wildlife with the potential to occur on site has been reviewed, including state and
federally listed species. Wetland jurisdictional limits have been identified pursuant to
SWFWMD criteria. At time of development, a specific flood study will be prepared to
determine the extent of the flood plain and areas of impact will be fully mitigated in
accordance with all jurisdictional agency requirements.  Coordination will occur with
other water resource agencies as permits are prepared.

A preliminary assessment by staff found habitats possibly supporting endangered
species. Prior to site plan approval, the petitioner shall provide a report from a qualified
professional, indicating the existence of threatened or endangered species on the site.
If any species are identified, a full assessment shall be conducted. The assessment
should demonstrate practicable avoidance, then minimization, and finally mitigation.

To ensure that the wetlands on site are protected; the following policies are proposed to
the Future Land Use Element:

Policy 1.4.10:

Incorporation of Category 2 wetlands into surface water management systems shall be
required to enhance hydrology and functional characteristics.

Policy 1.4.11:

If wetland impacts occur, a Wetland Mitigation Plan shall be submitted as part of the site
plan review process for review and approval by the City of Winter Haven.. The plan
shall be developed in cooperation with wetland regulatory agencies (SWFWMD and the
Department of Army, Corps of Engineers) as appropriate, to provide significant long
term hydrological and environmental benefit. The plan shall provide for the following:

a. On-site mitigation alternatives to the greatest extent possible. If on-site
mitigation is not possible, off-site mitigation within the Peace Creek
Watershed shall be provided;

b. Post-development onsite wetlands shall be protected and buffered by natural
habitat. Swales and stormwater ponds that are created for stormwater
attenuation and treatment may be located within buffers; and

c. Improvement of lost hydrologic functions within the watershed, including
recharge, water quality, and flood attenuation.

14



Planning Commission Meeting

March 2, 2010

COMPREHENSIVE PLAN:

The current Future Land Use for the parcels is Polk County Institutional-2. The
requested Future Land Uses are Industrial with a Business-Park Center overlay and
Conservation which are described below.

Policy 1.5.1:

Policy 1.6.3:

Industrial classifications are established and shown on the Future Land
Use Map, in accordance with the following classifications and gross
densities.

(b.)

Business-Park Center (BPC) Overlay. The BPC overlay
classification is in addition to the requirements of the industrial
land use classification:

Usable Site Area: 10 or more acres per BPC
Gross Leasable Area: 500,000 SF minimum per BPC

Typical Tenant: One or more warehouse facilities or
light assembly plants

Other Tenants: Offices, distribution centers, research
and development firms, retail,
institutional uses, and high density
residential.

Lot Coverage (Max.): 50% per site
Floor Area Ratio (Max.): 0.5 per site; industrial office
Floor Area Ratio (Max.): 0.3 per site; other types

100-year floodplains adjacent to lakeshores and jurisdictional
wetlands, shall be grouped and so designated on the Future Land
Use Map as Conservation. Areas adjacent to lakeshores that lie
within the 100-year floodplain that are ten (10) acres or more in size
shall be designated as “Conservation” on the Future Land Use
Map. Wetlands and 100-year floodplains adjacent to lakeshores
less than ten (10) acres on any parcel do not need to be shown on
the Future Land Use Map unless the wetland or 100-year floodplain
adjacent to lakeshores are part of a contiguous system, when
combines, totals ten (10) acres or more in size. Wetlands and 100-
year floodplains adjacent to lakeshores less than ten (10) acres in
size shall be delineated at the time of development and are subject
to the same protection standards and guidelines applicable to the
Conservation areas shown on the Future Land Use Map. Their
hydrologic functions and habitat characteristics shall be protected
through the enforcement of land development regulations, including

15



Planning Commission Meeting
March 2, 2010

zoning, regulation and prohibition of certain uses, and stormwater
treatment regulations.

Where development is allowed, density shall not exceed one (1
residential dwelling unit per five (5) acres.

Assignment of Industrial with a Business-Park Center Overlay Future Land Use to this
area will continue the City’s goal to relocate industrial uses from older, scattered areas
of the City to more viable, concentrated areas.

NOTIFICATION:

All public notice requirements have been met. In addition, notices were sent to property
owners who received notices for the Evansville Western DRI public hearing in 2008.

RECOMMENDATION:
The Planning Commission recommend approval of this request.

Chairman Joiner closed the Planning Commission meeting and opened the public
hearing.

Elizabeth Abernethy, a planner with Wilson-Miller signed in and advised that she was
available for questions from the Commission. No questions were asked. Chairman
Joiner closed the public hearing and re-opened the Planning Commission meeting.

Commissioner Smith moved to recommend approval of Case Number P-10-13.
Commissioner Spencer seconded the motion. The motion carried unanimously
by a roll call vote.

8. COMMENTS PLANNING COMMISSION/STAFF

Sean Byers advised that there were currently no cases for the April meeting. He also
stated that the next agenda would include election of officers.

9. ADJOURNMENT
Meeting adjourned at 7:36 p.m.

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN, FLORIDA

Commissioner Joiner, Chair
ATTEST:

Bethany Owen, Executive Assistant

16



CITY OF WINTER HAVEN FACT SHEET
PLANNING COMMISSION MEETING

April 6, 2010
DATE: March 29, 2010
TO: Winter Haven Planning Commissioners
VIA: David Dickey, Community Development Directo@

FROM: Tanya Willis, Code Enforcement SupervisoiD\\\)

SUBJECT: Ordinance 0O-10-15: Administrative request to adopt the
International Property Maintenance Code

BACKGROUND:

On October 11, 1993, the City adopted the Standard Housing Code (SHC) as
promulgated by Southern Building Code Congress International, Inc. (SBCCI)
(one of the three historical regional model building code groups in the United
States). The SHC sets minimum standards for the interior and exterior
maintenance of improved residential properties in the City.

Recognizing the demand for a unified set of standards for the construction and
building maintenance industries in the United States and abroad, in 1994 the
SBCCI, along with its two sister model building code groups, created a parent
organization called the International Code Council (ICC) to develop a nationwide
building code standard as well as a nationwide property maintenance standard
for all buildings, not just residential sites. The culmination of the ICC’s work on
property maintenance was the publication of the first International Property
Maintenance Code (IPMC) in 1998.

As stated in the IPMC's introduction page, the IPMC is “founded on principles
intended to establish provisions consistent with the scope of a property
maintenance code that adequately protects public health safety and welfare,
provisions that do not unnecessarily increase construction costs, provisions that
do not restrict the use of new materials, products or methods of construction, and
provisions that do not give preferential treatment to particular types or classes of
materials, products or methods of construction.”

Shortly after the publication of the first International Property Maintenance Code,
SBCCI merged with its parent organization, ICC, and ceased creating and
publishing revisions to the outdated Standard Housing Code, given that the most
recent revision of the SHC was drafted in 1997.



Because the SHC is no longer updated or commented upon by a national-level
maintenance code standards review group, staff has requested that the City
Commission consider adopting the 2009 version of the IPMC as the minimum
property maintenance standards of the City, with local revisions to comply with
Florida law and historical City practice. If adopted, the IPMC would for the first
time prescribe standards for maintaining commercial structures in the City as well
as create new, revised and updated standards for maintaining residential
properties.

Notable highlights of the IPMC (with local amendments) include:

(a) increased enforcement of “living standards” regulations (light, ventilation,
living space, heating and sanitation) in housing quarters, improving overall
quality of rental units;

(b) increased focus on the commercial sector, requiring that commercial
structures be maintained to similar standards as residential buildings;

(c) legislative authorization for officers to use any method of available code
enforcement to bring an IPMC violation into compliance, including
citations, demands for correction/removal, or charge filings before the
City’s special magistrate;

(d)  creation of an enhanced ability for City officials to “close” dangerous or
abandoned structures (commercial or residential) in an effort to protect the
health, safety and welfare of the City’s residents should the situation
require; and

(e) allowance for adjustment to IPMC requirements as adjudicated by the
City’s Board of Adjustment, should such adjustments be necessary and
meet the standard criteria for a variance of land development regulations
(essentially, necessity and lack of fault)

Upon adoption of the ordinance, nuisance abatement liens would have “special
assessment” and “super-lien” status (equivalent to the lien of municipal taxes) to
prevent their discharge in a foreclosure action. References to the “Board of
Adjustment” in the Chapter 12 abatement order process would be properly
changed to “Code Enforcement Special Master” upon passage, harmonizing the
provisions with §§2-61, et seq. of the Code of Ordinances. Finally, new Section
12-11 of the Code of Ordinances would allow the City Manager discretion to
prepare a non-ad valorem property tax assessment collection resolution for
consideration by the City Commission for unpaid abatement and correction liens,
should such measures be deemed necessary.

In anticipation of transitioning to the IPMC as an enforcement mechanism, in
2003, it became a condition of employment as a City Code Enforcement Officer
to obtain “ICC Property Maintenance and Housing Inspector” certification within
three (3) years of being hired or promoted. This certification of training enables



Code Enforcement Officers to properly enforce the IPMC, should the City
Commission choose to adopt it. Since all Code Enforcement Officers have
obtained certification, implementation of the IPMC will not be delayed due to staff
training. However, an effective date of August 1, 2010 is recommended to allow
Staff time to conduct a public awareness campaign.

Other Florida municipalities that have adopted the IPMC include Auburndale,
Haines City, Winter Park, Oviedo, Plant City, Bradenton, and Boca Raton.

On March 8, 2010, the City Commission approved adoption of the IPMC on 1°
reading. However, the Commission raised several questions (see attached
memo dated March 26, 2010, from Drew Crawford) and directed staff to conduct
a public hearing to allow for public input on the proposed code. For that purpose,
a public hearing with the Planning Commission has been scheduled.

NOTIFICATION:

All public notice requirements for this request have been met. To encourage
public participation a notice for the Planning Commission meeting was forwarded
to a number of entities potentially affected by this code, to include:

e The Polk County Builders Association
e East Polk Association of Realtors
o Winter Haven Main Street

e Winter Haven Chamber of Commerce

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the Planning Commission recommend approval of
Ordinance O-10-15.

ATTACHMENTS:
March 26, 2010 memo from Drew Crawford, Asst. City Attorney

Ordinance O-10-15
International Property Maintenance Code (with local amendments)



P.O. Drawer 30
Bartow, Florida 33831

B OSWELL @5 D UN LAR» 245 South Central Avenue

ATTORNEYS AT LAW - ESTABLISHED 1900 Bartow, Florida 33830
Phone: (863) 533-7117 |

Fax: (863) 533-7412

MEMORANDUM

TO: Dale L. Smith, City Manager
David Dickey, Community Development Director
Tanya Willis, Code Enforcement Supervisor
Frederick J. Murphy. Jr, City Attorney

FROM: W.A. "Drew" Crawford, Assistant City Attorney
DATE: March 26, 2010

IN RE: Ordinance O-10-15 (IPMC Adoption); Questions and Comments from City
Commissioners

At the City Commission’s March 8, 2010 meeting, several comments and questions were
raised regarding language found in §§4 and 5 of proposed Ordinance 0-10-15 (the International
Property Maintenance Code (“IPMC”) adoption Ordinance). Most Commissioner comments
centered on “conflict resolution” provisions -- standard clauses often included in complex
legislation clarifying the intent of the enacting body and prescribing a method for resolving
unintended or unforeseen conflicts between existing municipal laws and new enactments. Other
comments were substantive questions directed at individual policies contained within the
Revised IPMC’s text.

This memorandum aims to answer Commissioner questions on conflict resolution as well
as introduce new draft language to the proposed Ordinance in preparation for a public hearing

scheduled before the City’s Planning Commission April 6.

Executive Summary

Conflict resolution language is not new to the law. When enacting “form” documents into
law, such as the text of the IPMC (a document prepared by third party International Code
Council, Inc.), conflict resolution language is necessary in order to establish the hierarchy of
supremacy; without it, interpreting authorities would look to the most recent statement of law,
which may or may not express the true intent of the legislative body.

Regarding substantive questions:



Page 2 BOSWELL & DUNLAP LLP
March 26, 2010

Commission Notification: Language has been added to the proposed Ordinance
instructing the City Manager to notify individual members of the City Commission, if and when
emergency closure power is exercised as provided in §5 of Ordinance O-10-15. See Prospective
§5-73(bb), Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven; Prospective §109.4, IPMC, as

amended.

Florida Friendly Landscaping: Florida Friendly Landscapes maintained in an
aesthetically appealing manner that do not constitute a dangerous condition are exempted from
the 12 weeds and overgrowth height limit. See Prospective §5-73(hh), Code of Ordinances of the
City of Winter Haven (Prospective §302.4, IPMC, as amended); Prospective §12-1 of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven. Please note that the addition of this language to
Ordinance 0-10-15 requires a title amendment to be voted on at Second Reading.

Elevated Buildings: Prospective §5-71(11) of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter
Haven (Prospective §304.19, IPMC, as amended) requires that all buildings with floors elevated
above ground to install latticework or other similar approved material along the outside
perimeter of the structure. This would impact buildings on stilts within in the City’s municipal

limits.

Courtesy Notice: Language has been added to Ordinance 0-10-15 confirming the ability
of Code Enforcement Officers to issue courtesy notifications, such as letters or door hangers, to
apprise persons of alleged violations of both the IPMC, as amended, and the Code of Ordinances
of the City of Winter Haven.

Transition Date: City Staff has proposed an effective transition date of June 1, 2010. As

this 1s a matter of policy, a different effective date may be suggested by the City Commission and
the Planning Commission after each body’s respective public hearing on the proposed Ordinance.

Conflict Resolution

Fluid legal documents, such as the Florida Statutes, or a Florida city’s official Code of
Ordinances, often contain unintentional conflicting statements of primary law. Since 1916,
Florida Courts have followed a rule of decision in solving statutory conflicts, if they occur, in the
absence of any conflict resolution language:

“ ... Where there is material repugnance in statutory regulations, or where there is anything
from which an intent that a later act shall supersede a prior act may be fairly inferred, it will be
given that effect, particularly when the later act covers a broader general subject and contains a
portion of the particular prouvisions of the former act, and adds to some portions and omits other
portions of such particular provisions so as to make such particular regulations contained in the
prior act conform to the purpose and policy of the later act, covering a broader subject, including
the lesser.”

Sparkman v. State, 71 Fla. 210, 71 So. 34, 39 (Fla. 1916) (emphasis added); Berkeley v. State,
Dep’t of Env. Reg., 358 So. 2d 552, 553 (Fla. 1st DCA 1978). This rule of decision essentially
means that later acts of government will be given primary effect by Florida courts, especially if
they cover the same subject matter and state a new standard.




Page 3 BOSWELL & DUNLAP LLP
March 26, 2010

This rule of decision becomes a particular problem in periodically updated documents
incorporated into law, such as the former Standard Housing Code, the Florida Building Code and
the International Property Maintenance Code. Without taking due legislative care in deciding
how conflicting provisions of law should be handled, unintended consequences can arise that can
have disastrous effects on prosecutions.

The way for legislative bodies to ensure a particular rule of decision in the event a
statutory conflict occurs is to provide for resolution of conflicts in the substantive law. Proposed
Ordinance O-10-15 contains three resolution statements, each of which is intended by the
Ordinance’s drafters to cover a different situation:

(a) §4 (Proposed §5-72, Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven):

In the event of a conflict between the provisions of the International Property
Maintenance Code, adopted by the prouvisions of this article, and the provisions of the
Code of Ordinances, the Code of Ordinances shall prevail.

(b) §5 (Proposed §5-73(b), Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven; Proposed
§102.1, IPMC, as amended):

Where, in a specific case, different sections of this code specify different
requirements, the most restrictive will govern.

(0) §5 (Proposed §5-73(e), Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven; Proposed
§102.7, IPMC, as amended):

Where differences occur between prouvisions of this code and the referenced
standards, the more stringent standard shall apply.

Item (a), proposed §5-72 of the Code, is designed to legislatively ensure that the Code of
Ordinances of the City shall always prevail over the incorporated form documents. Primarily,
this provision was added to the draft Ordinance to ensure proposed §5-73 s local modifications to
the IPMC were given full force and effect; notably however, the added side effect of proposed §5-
72 is to validate existing and future acts of the Winter Haven City Commission that may be
construed as conflicting with the IPMC, under certain circumstances. For example,

§302.8 of the IPMC prohibits inter alia “[p]ainting of vehicles  unless conducted inside
an approved spray booth.” §21-31 of the Code of Ordinances limits automotive paint shops
to the C4, 11 and 12 zoning districts of the City. Given that §302.8 of the IPMC is, for
argument purposes, the later enacted law, proposed §5-72 of the Code of Ordinances
ensures that painting of vehicles will not take place in zoning districts other than C4, I1
and I2, regardless of whether any given accessory structure could be argued to be an
“approved” spray booth. (Essentially, proposed §5-72 forecloses a creative Sparkman
argument that paint booths are authorized commercial uses under the IPMC in a used
vehicle sales facility located on a C3 zoned parcel.)



Page 4 BOSWELL & DUNLAP LLP
March 26, 2010

Item (b), proposed §5-73(b), Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven (proposed §102.1,
IPMC, as amended) is focused on ensuring stringency of the IPMC, as applied under the
circumstances. For example,

§§309.4 and 309.5 of the IPMC deal with pest elimination. §309.5 requires “[t]he occupant
of any structure” to be “responsible for the continued rodent and pest-free condition of the
structure” whereas §309.4 of the IPMC requires “[t]he owner of a structure containing two
or more dwelling units” to be “responsible for extermination in the public or shared areas
of the structure”. Since §309.4 is more restrictive by requiring a non-occupant to have
responsibility for pest extermination, proposed §5-73(b) of the Code of Ordinances ensures
that, in multi-dwelling buildings, the owner takes care of pest extermination in public

areas.

Item (c), proposed §5-73(e), Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven (proposed §102.7,
IPMC, as amended) is also focused on ensuring stringency. The IPMC references numerous
standards, all of which are identified in the Chapter 8 index. Notably, proposed §102.7 of the
IPMC, as amended, allows agencies charged with publishing referenced standards to prescribe
new stringency levels to ensure proper functioning and compliance as maintenance methods and
materials change over time, with changes made to referenced documents being automatically
incorporated into the City of Winter Haven’s minimum property maintenance standards. This
prevents the City from having to revisit the IPMC’s effectiveness each time a standards agency
decides to publish a new edition of industry practices; if the industry practice is more stringent
than that currently prescribed in the IPMC, as amended, the more stringent practice controls.

Conclusion

Ordinance O-10-15 s conflict resolution procedures have been narrowly tailored to achieve
desired effects while minimizing the amount of “legislative maintenance” required to keep the
proposed law applicable to modern structures and modern practices. Other substantive law
questions have either been addressed or highlighted in the proposed text for further discussion

at the staff level.






ORDINANCE NO. 0-10-15

AN ORDINANCE RELATING TO PROPERTY STANDARDS AND
ENFORCEMENT; REVISING SECTIONS 5-71, 5-72, 5-73, 12-1,
12-7, 12-8 AND 12-9 AND CREATING SECTION 12-11 OF THE
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF WINTER HAVEN;
ESTABLISHING THE MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING
THE CONDITIONS AND MAINTENANCE OF ALL PROPERTY,
BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES IN THE CITY; PROVIDING THE
STANDARDS AND CONDITIONS ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT
STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY AND FIT FOR
OCCUPATION AND USE; PROVIDING FOR THE
CONDEMNATION OF BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES UNFIT
FOR HUMAN OCCUPANCY; AUTHORIZING THE CITY’S CODE
ENFORCEMENT SPECIAL MASTER TO HEAR APPEALS OF
CHAPTER 12 ADMINISTRATIVE ABATEMENT ORDERS; GIVING
CHAPTER 12 ABATEMENT LIENS SPECIAL ASSESSMENT
STATUS AND SUPER-PRIORITY; AUTHORIZING THE CITY
COMMISSION TO COLLECT CODE ENFORCEMENT SPECIAL
ASSESSMENT LIENS ON PROPERTY TAX BILLS; REPEALING
CONFLICTING ORDINANCES; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY,
CONTINUANCE OF LEGAL ACTIONS, CODIFICATION AND AN
EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, pursuant to §5-71 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter
Haven, the minimum housing standards of the city are articulated by the 1994 “Standard
Housing Code” (as amended), published by “Southern Building Code Congress
International” (“SBCCI"); and

WHEREAS, §§5-71 through 5-73 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter
Haven currently only prescribe minimum maintenance standards for residential
structures and buildings; and

WHEREAS, in 1998, SBCCI, a statutory member of the “International Code
Council” (“ICC"), participated in the development of the first edition of the “International
Property Maintenance Code” (IPMC”); and

WHEREAS, the IPMC prescribes minimum maintenance standards for both



residential and commercial structures and buildings; and

WHEREAS, the most current edition of the IPMC was released by the ICC in
2009; and

WHEREAS, it is desifable and beneficial to the citizens and residents of Winter
Haven, Florida for the City Commission to adopt the IPMC, with certain local
amendments, in order to properly secure the health safety and welfare of the public by
prescribing minimum property maintenance standards for all buildings and structures
within the City’s municipal limits; and

WHEREAS, municipal abatement of nuisances and municipal correction of code
enforcement violations provide a special and unique and benefit accruing to ba—nicular
property in the City where such activities take place; and

WHEREAS, the City’s current abatement lien scheme should be expanded to
allow the City to use the special assessment process, including, at the option of the City
Commission, the collection of assessments via property tax bills, so that the general
public is remunerated for providing a special and unique benefit to particular properties
in the City where municipalv abatement or municipal correction of code enforéement
violations occur; NOW, THEREFORE,

BE IT ENACTED BY THE PEOPLE OF THE CITY OF WINTER HAVEN:

SECTION 1. Chapter 5, Article VI of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter
Haven is renamed to read:
ARTICLE VI. MINIMUM PROPERTY MAINTENANCE STANDARDS

SECTION 2. Sections 5-71, 5-72 and 5-73 of the Code of Ordinances of the City

of Winter Haven existing as of the day before Second Reading of this Ordinance are



hereby repealed in their entirety.
SECTION 3. Section 5-71, Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven is
enacted to read:

Sec. 5-71. International Property Maintenance Code adopted.

The International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 Edition, as published by the

International Code Council, Inc. is hereby adopted and incorporated by reference as the

Minimum Property Maintenance Standards of the City subject to and including by

reference such additions and amendments that may be adopted by the City by

Ordinance.
SECTION 4. Section 5-72 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven
is enacted to read:

Sec. 5-72. Conflicts.

In the event of a conflict between the provisions of the International Property

Maintenance Code, adopted by the provisions of this article, and the provisions of the

Code of Ordinances, the Code of Ordinances shall prevail.

SECTION 5. Section 5-73 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven
is enacted to read:

Sec. 5-73. Modifications, amendments, deletions.

The International Property Maintenance Code, 2009 edition, incorporated by

reference in Section 5-71 is modified as specified hereunder:

(a) Section 101.1 is amended to read:

101.1 Title.

These regulations shall be known as the Minimum Property Maintenance




Standards of the City of Winter Haven, hereinafter referred to as “this code”

(b) Section 102.1 is amended to read:

102.1 General.

Where there is a specific conflict between a general requirement of this code and

a specific requirement of this code, the specific requirement shall govern. Where

differences occur between provisions of this code, and any referenced standard in this

code, this code shall generally govern, except that Chapter 553, Florida Statutes, the

Florida Building Code and all referenced standards in the Florida Building Code shall

control all_ matters relating to building construction, repair and remodeling and the

Florida Fire Prevention Code / Florida Life Safety Code shall control all matters relating

to fire safety. Where, in a specific case, different sections of this code specify different

requirements, the most restrictive will govern.

(c) Section 102.3 is amended to read:

102.3 Application of other codes.

Repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy, shall be

done in accordance with the procedures and provisions of Chapter 553, Florida Statutes

and any applicable building codes, including, but not limited to, the Florida Building

Code. Nothing in this code shall be construed to cancel, modify or set aside any of the

provisions of Chapter 553, Florida Statutes or any applicable building codes to a

particular project, including, but not limited to, the Florida Building Code or any

referenced standard therein.

(d) Section 102.6 is amended to read:

102.6 Historic Buildings.




The provisions of this code shall not be mandatory for existing buildings or

structures that are designated as historic by the National Park Service and listed on the

National Register of Historic Places when such buildings or structures are judged by the

Code Official to be safe and in the public interest of health, safety, and welfare.

(e)  Section 102.7 is amended to read:

102.7 Referenced codes and standards.

The codes and standards referenced throughout this code shall be considered

part of this code and are accordingly adopted and incorporated herein by reference to

the prescribed extent of such reference. Where differences occur between provisions of

this code and the referenced standards, the more stringent standard shall apply.

(f) Section 102.8 is amended to read:

102.8 Requirements not covered by code.

Requirements necessary for the strength, stability or proper operation of an

existing fixture, structure or equipment, or for the public safety, health, and general

welfare, not specifically covered by this code shall be determined by the Code Official

using the following:

(1) Reference to the manufacturer's suggested gquidelines or instructions for

installation and use;

(2)  Reference to the Florida Building Code or any other applicable building

code;

(3) Reference to primary law (including federal, state, and local sources):

(4) Reference to any generally accepted practice in the industry, occupation,

or general use for which the existing fixture, structure or equipment is primarily




designated for, or for which the public health, safety, and welfare requires; or

(5) Reference to any other suitably acceptable source of custom or practice

reasonably accepted by society and sufficiently reliable in _nature such that the

requirement would be generally known and accepted in the community.

The Code Official, upon observing a deficiency in a requirement necessary for

the strength, stability or proper operation of an existing fixture, structure or equipment,

or for the public safety, health, and general welfare, shall, in addition to regular

enforcement protocol, issue along with the first notice a written determination including

the basis for requirement and the necessary steps to correct the deficiency observed to

meet the requirement.

(@) Section 103 is renamed “Code Enforcement Unit”

(h) Section 103.1 is amended to read:

103.1_Code officials.

Each Code Enforcement Officer of the City is deemed a “code official’ for

purposes of this code. Any notices required to be delivered to the code official under

this code shall be delivered to the responsible Code Enforcement Officer for the case.

(i) Sections 103.2 and 103.3 are deleted.

)} Section 103.4 is amended to read:

103.4 Liability.

In accordance with §768.28(9)(a), Florida Statutes, a City official or employee

charged with the enforcement of this code shall not be held personally liable in tort or

named as a party defendant in any action for any injury or damage suffered as a result

of any act, event, or omission of action in the scope of her or his employment or




function, unless such officer, employee, or agent acted in bad faith or with malicious

purpose or in a manner _exhibiting wanton and willful disregard of human rights, safety.

or property.
(k) Section 103.5 is deleted.

(1) Section 104.1 is amended to read:

104.1 General.

The code official shall enforce the provisions of this code.

(m)  Section 105.1 is amended to read:

105.1 Modifications.

Whenever there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of

this code, the Board of Adjustment, or its functional equivalent, shall have the authority

to grant modifications for individual cases in accordance with the procedure for granting

variances found in Sections 21-421 and 21-422 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of

Winter Haven. No modification from the terms of this code shall be issued unless the

Board of Adjustment finds, based on competent substantial evidence, that all of the

facts and conditions exist for variances as outlined in Section 21-422 of the Code of

Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven along with the following:

(1) The requested modification is in compliance with the intent and purpose of

this code; and

(2) The requested modification does not lessen health, life, and safety

requirements.

Should the Board of Adjustment approve a modification to this code, the Board

shall adopt an order by resolution stating thereto and shall forward a copy of the




modification to the Code Official for placement in the Code Official's files and a copy of

the modification to the Building Official for placement in the Building Official's files.

Modifications to this code granted by the Board of Adjustment are not variances

and do not run with the land, and upon the application for a building permit from the City

for the subject building, structure or premises by the owner or occupant thereof, such

modifications shall cease to be in existence and the subject building, structure or

premises must be brought into compliance with this code as a condition of issuance of

the permit.

Any aggrieved person adversely affected by a decision of the Board of

Adjustment pursuant to this Section shall, within thirty (30) days of rendition of the

Board’s decision, appeal to an applicable Court of law in accordance with the Florida

Rules of Appellate Procedure by filing with such Court a petition for writ of certiorari.

Such an appeal shall be in the nature of that from a final administrative decision.

(n) Section 106.2 is amended to read:

106.2 Enforcement Protocol.

The Code Official shall enforce the provisions of this Code in any manner or

protocol available including, but not limited to, issuance of a citation pursuant to

§162.21, Florida Statutes and §2-201, et seq., Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter

Haven, a “Notice of Hearing” pursuant to §162.12, Florida Statutes and §2-61, et seq.,

Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven, a “Notice to Appear” pursuant to

§162.23, Florida Statutes, a “Demand for Removal’ pursuant to §12-1, et. seq., Code of

Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven, a “Demand for Correction” pursuant to §106.3

of this code, or referral to the City Attorney for filing a civil enforcement action. The




enumeration of remedies and protocols herein does not constrain the Code Official who,

as _an officer of a Florida municipality endowed with home rule authority, may use any

lawful means necessary to bring a code violation into compliance, to restrain, correct, or

to prevent illegal occupancy of any building, structure or premises, or to stop an illegal

act, conduct, business or utilization of any building, structure or premises.

(o) Section 106.3 is amended to read:

106.3 Declaration of nuisance; demand for correction.

A violation of any provision of this code is deemed to be a nuisance affecting the

public health, safety and welfare, and accordingly, the Code Official is hereby

authorized and empowered to notify, in_writing, the owner or agent of such owner, of

any building, structure or premises within the City, to make such repairs as may be

required to abate the nuisance condition and bring such building, structure or premises

into compliance. Notice shall be provided to the owner or agent of such owner either (a)

in the manner described in §162.12, Florida Statutes, or (b) in the manner described in

8§12-4, Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven.

The notice required to be given herein shall set forth the legal description of the

property underlying the building, structure or premises as is set forth in the latest tax roll

prepared by the county, and shall specify a reasonable time in which the owner or agent

of the owner shall abate the condition and bring such building, structure or premises into

compliance. Such notice shall have attached thereto a true copy of this section.

Included in the notice shall be a statement informing the owner that all costs incurred by

the City in abating the nuisance condition and repairing the condition and bring such

building, structure or premises into compliance shall be billed to the property owner.




Upon the failure, neglect or refusal of any owner or the agent of such owner so

notified to abate the nuisance condition and make repairs within the reasonable time

specified after posting the building, structure or premises, the Code Official is hereby

authorized to order the repair of the building, structure or premises and bill the owner for

the work.

Any owner aggrieved by the findings and order of the Code Official shall have the

right to appeal said decision prior to the expiration of the time within which such owner

was given to abate the nuisance. Any appeal taken must be requested, in writing, and

timely received by the City Clerk at 451 3rd Street, N.W., Winter Haven, Florida. In the

event the time for owner to abate the nuisance expires on a weekend, evening or a

holiday, the owner shall have until 5:00 p.m. the next business day to file the request for

appeal. Such written notice or request may be in any form which clearly notifies the City

of the owner's request. The Code Official shall place the appeal on the agenda of the

next scheduled Code Enforcement Special Master Hearing or may request a special

meeting to hear the appeal. Any appeal shall stay all proceedings in furtherance with

the action appealed from until after the hearing is held. At such hearing, the rules of the

Special Master concerning appeals shall be followed. It shall be the responsibility of the

owner of the property in question to show that the City's actions are without reason. The

Special Master shall determine whether the appeal is justified. If not, the City shall

proceed with the abatement.

After abatement and billing by the City, where the full amount due the City is not

paid by the owner of the building, structure or premises within thirty (30) days after the

biling date, the Code Official shall cause to be recorded in the public records of the

10



county, a sworn statement showing the cost and expense incurred for the work and the

date, place and property on which such work was done, and the recordation of such

sworn statement shall constitute a special assessment lien on the property equivalent to

the lien of municipal taxes and taking precedence over all other recorded liens, and

shall remain in full force and effect for the amount due on principal and interest, plus

costs of court, if any, for collection, until final payment has been made. Such special

assessment lien may be foreclosed in the manner provided for by general law.

This provision is supplemental in nature and is not intended to be the exclusive

remedy by which this code may be enforced.

(p) Section 106.4 is amended to read:

106.4 Violation penalties; remedies additional and supplemental.

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code, or fail to comply therewith,

or with any of the requirements thereof, may be prosecuted within the limits provided by

general or local laws. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been

served shall be deemed a separate offense. Each remedy provided for in this code is

an additional and supplemental means of enforcing city codes and ordinances and may

be used for the enforcement of this code singularly or in tandem. Nothing contained

herein shall prohibit the city from enforcing its codes and ordinances by any other

means.

(Q) Section 106.5 is amended to read:

106.5 Abatement of violation.

The imposition of the penalties herein shall not preclude the Code Official from

referring a_particular case to the City Attorney to institute an_appropriate action to

11



restrain, correct, or to prevent illegal occupancy of a building, structure or premises, or

to stop an illegal act, conduct, business or_utilization of the building, structure or

premises.

(r) Section 107.1 is amended to read:

107.1 Notices.

Notice of a violation of this code shall be delivered in accordance with the

substantive law governing the Code Official’'s chosen enforcement protocol or protocols.

(s) Sections 107.2, 107.3 and 107.5 are deleted.

(t) Section 107.6 is amended to read:

107.6 Transfer of ownership.

It shall be unlawful for the owner of any building, structure or premises who has

received a citation, a notice of violation, a demand for removal or a demand for

correction to sell, transfer, mortgage, lease, or otherwise dispose of such building.

structure, or premises until the provisions of the citation, notice of violation, demand for

removal or demand for correction have been complied with, or until such owner shall

first furnish the grantee, transferee, mortgagee or lessee a true copy of the citation,

notice of violation, demand for removal or demand for correction and then provide to the

Code Official a signed and notarized statement from the grantee, transferee, mortgagee

or lessee acknowledging the receipt of such citation, notice of violation, demand for

removal or demand for correction and fully accepting the responsibility without condition

for making the corrections or repairs required thereby.

A true and correct copy of this section shall be attached to all citations, notices of

violation, demands for removal and demands for correction issued pursuant to this

12



code, although the failure to attach a copy thereto will not affect the validity of the

instrument, nor shall it affect the validity of this section.

Any person violating this section shall be subject to the penalty found in §1-13,

Code of Ordinances of the City of Winter Haven.

(u) Section 108.1.5 is amended to read:

108.1.5 Dangerous structure or premises.

For the purpose of this code, any structure or premises that has any or all of the

conditions or defects described below shall be considered dangerous.

1. Any door, aisle, passageway, stairway, exit or other means of egress that

does not conform to the requirements for existing buildings identified in Chapter 553,

Florida Statutes, the Florida Building Code, the Florida Fire Prevention Code or the

Florida Life Safety Code.

2. The walking surface of any aisle, passageway, stairway, exit or other

means of egress is so warped worn loose, torn or otherwise unsafe as to not provide

safe and adequate means of egress.

3. Any portion of a building, structure or appurtenance that has been

damaged by fire, earthquake, wind, flood, deterioration, neglect, abandonment,

vandalism or by any other cause to such an extent that it is likely to partially or

completely collapse, or to become detached or dislodged.

4. Any portion of a building, or any member, appurtenance or ornamentation

on the exterior thereof that is not of sufficient strength or stability, or is not so anchored,

attached or fastened in place so as to be capable of resisting natural or artificial loads of

one and one-half the original designed value.

13



5. The building or structure, or part of the building or structure, because of

dilapidation, deterioration, decay, faulty construction, the removal or movement of some

portion of the ground necessary for the support, or for any other reason, is likely to

partially or completely collapse, or some portion of the foundation or underpinning of the

building or structure is likely to fail or give way.

6. The building or structure, or any portion thereof, is clearly unsafe for its

use and occupancy.

7. The building or structure is neglected, damaged, dilapidated, unsecured or

abandoned so as to become an attractive nuisance to children who might play in the

building or_structure to their danger, becomes a harbor for vagrants, criminals or

immoral persons, or enables persons to resort to the building or structure for committing

a nuisance or an unlawful act.

8. Any building or structure has been constructed, exists or is maintained in

violation of any specific requirement or prohibition applicable to such building or

structure provided by the approved building or fire code of the jurisdiction, or of any law

or ordinance to such an extent as to present either a substantial risk of fire, building

collapse or any other threat to life and safety.

9. A building or structure, used or intended to be used for dwelling purposes,

because of inadequate maintenance, dilapidation, decay, damage, fauity construction or

arrangement, inadequate light, ventilation, mechanical or plumbing system, or

otherwise, is determined by the code official to be unsanitary, unfit for habitation or in

such a condition that is likely to cause sickness or disease.

10. Any building or structure, because of lack of sufficient or proper fire-

14



resistance-related construction, fire protection systems, electrical system, fuel

connections, mechanical system, plumbing system or other cause, is determined by the

code official to be a threat to life or health.

11. Any portion of a building remains on a site after the demolition or

destruction of the building or structure or whenever any building or structure is

abandoned so as to constitute such building or portion thereof as an attractive nuisance

or hazard to the public.

(v) Section 108.2 is amended to read:

108.2 Closing of vacant structures.

If a structure is vacant and unfit for human habitation and occupancy, and is not

in danger for structural collapse. but is open such that the interior of the structure is

easily accessible through open or broken windows, open or broken doors, or missing

structural elements, the Code Official is authorized to issue a demand for correction in

accordance with §106.3 of this code.

Alternatively, should the vacant structure

(1) pose an imminent danger to the health, safety, and welfare of the general

public;

(2) be occupied periodically by transients or itinerants; or

(3) be utilized for illegal conduct in violation of any federal, state or local law,

the Code Official is authorized to have the structure immediately closed up so as not to

be an attractive nuisance by posting a notice at each entrance to the building entitled

“Notice of Section 108.2 Closing” and by sealing each accessible entrance. A “Notice of

Section 108.2 Closing” shall be in substantially the following form:

15



