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BID NO: RFQ-11-87 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 09/12/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Misc Utility ltems - 12" Bidder No 1 Bidder No 2
Dundee Road Frischkorn Inc / Ferguson Ferguson Waterworks
Lakeland, FL Winter Haven, FL
fitem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
400(12" HDPE DR11 Pipe $20.56 $8,224.00 $21.00 $8,400.00
B 200]12" C900 Blue Pipe $35.66 $7,132.00 $15.94 $3,188.00
C 20|12" Mega Lugs & Kits $145.93 $2,918.60 $62.65 $1,253.00§
D 8112" MJ 45 $265.00 $2,120.00 $131.30 $1,050.40
E 7|12" Befl Restraints No Bid No Bid $76.55 $535.85
F 2[12" HDPE Inserts No Bid No Bid $45.80 $91.608
G 4]12" x 2" MJ Caps $128.00 $512.00 $76.20 $304.80
H 4|Pre-Cast Thrust Blocks No Bid No Bid $29.00 $116.00
Grand Total Incomplete $14,939.65
Misc Utility ltems - 12" Bidder No 3 Bidder No
Dundee Road HD Supply Waterworks
Tampa, FL
fitem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
400}12" HDPE DR11 Pipe $21.58 $8,632.00
B 200}12" C900 Blue Pipe $15.62 $3,124.00
C 20{12" Mega Lugs & Kits $71.83 $1,436.60
D 8112" MJ 45 $136.77 $1,094.16
E 712" Bell Restraints $89.17 $624.19
F 2112" HDPE inserts $47.34 $94.68
G 4112" x 2" MJ Caps $78.97 $315.88
H 4{Pre-Cast Thrust Blocks $30.00 $120.00
Grand Total $15,441.51
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