BID NO: RFQ-11-76 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #1 Bidder #2
All Safe Industries Safety Products, Inc.
| _|Yearly Louisville, KY Lakeland, FL
fliter| Quanti Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 | . Miscellaneous Gloves: ‘ : o - o =
1 0|Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL, 100 gloves per $6.66 $2,997.00 $5.64 $2,538.00
2] 900|Gray shoulder gloves, split leather, paim safety cuff $1.80 $1,710.00 $1.00 $900.00
3| 340|PVC gloves, 14" black, rough finish, Large $2.55 $867.00 $2.13 $724.20)
4] 1000|Brown knit jersey gloves $0.77 $770.00 $0.57 $570.00,
$6,344.00 $4,732.20
Safety vests, Class 3 only; wi . 0 -
5 50|Medium $11.77 $588.50 $432.50,
6 82|Large $11.77 $965.14 $8.65 $709.30
7 82| X-large $11.77 $965.14 $8.65 $709.30,
8 50{2X $11.77 $588.50 $8.65 $432.50
9 10{4X $11.77 $117.70 $8.65 $86.50
10 10(56X $11.77 $117.70 $8.65 $86.50
) Total, items 5- $3,342.68 $2,456.60
Ll Batteries, alkaline only ; ; o ) :
11| 3000{AA $0.57 $1,710.00 $0.23 $690.00
12| 1300|AAA $0.67 $871.00 $0.23 $299.00
13| 800|C $1.22 $976.00 $0.49 $392.00
14| 800|D $1.34 $1,072.00 $0.64 $512.00
15f 500(9 volt $2.14 $1,070.00 $0.94 $470.00]
16| 100|6 voit with spring $3.70 $370.00 $1.43 $143.00]
; Total, Items 11-16 $6,069.00 $2,506.00
b  Back'support/brace L e e
17 12|Medium $8.98 $107.76 $5.00 $60.00
18 12{Large $8.98 $107.76 $5.00 $60.00,
19 12{XL $8.98 $107.76 $5.00 $60.00
20 12{3X $8.98 $107.76 $5.00 $60.00,
Total, ltems 17-20| $431.04 $240.00,
Prepared by: \N % o
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BID NO: RFQ-11-76 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:

BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #1 Bidder #2
Est. All Safe Industries Safety Products
| Yearly] Louisville, KY Lakeland, FL
Quant Uomo:u:o: Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Ooﬂ Total Cost|
Moldex mnm_,x Plugs ummma or mncm_ 100 pairs per box $27.75 $333.00 ﬁo oo $228.001
Dust Goggle o o L
>__mmﬁw mm<o_c=o: brand, black, visi clear or equal No Bid $7.35 $88.208
23| 125 wcvmmzo EC sci%_. ?a? mmo.wqm.x_. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
241 150{SUPRENQ EC Powder free, SEC-375-XXL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25| 300{Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $3.79 $1,137.00 $3.05 $915.00
26| 300|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $3.79 $1,137.00 $3.05 $915.00
271 350|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $3.79 $1,326.50 $3.28 $1,148.00
Total, Items 23-27 ] ) ~ Incomplete _anosvsnw
28| 144 m::? w Emmmo? clear $8.17 $1,176.48 $5.25 $756.00
291 350{Pyramex, zone 11 $3.93 $1,375.50 No Bid No Bid
Total, Items 28-. mo $2,551.98 Incomplete|
. Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only:
30 24 m_Nm a 86606 $17.95 $430.80 $12.30 $295.20;
31 60{SIZE 9 86606 $17.95 $1,077.00 $12.30 $738.00
32 60|SIZE 10 86606 $17.95 $1,077.00 $12.30 $738.00)
33 B0[SIZE 11 86606 $17.95 $1,077.00 $12.30 $738.00
34 60|SIZE 12 86606 $17.95 $1,077.00 $12.30 $738.00
35 48|SIZE 13 86606 $17.95 $861.60 $12.30 $590.40,
36 48|SIZE 14 86606 No Bid No Bid $12.30 $590.40,
$4,428.00
e 1 . Hard Hat, Bullard $71 brand only: L - il o
37 48 |Hard hat, (Full brim, white only) No Bid $10.60 $508.80
1 _ Respirators, full face, 3M brand only: ; . ok ¢
38 12{3M 6900 Respirator, large $112.30 $1,347.60 $99.60 $1,195.20,
39 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium $112.30 $1,347.60 $99.60 $1,195.20
40 12|3M 6700 Respirator, smatil $112.30 $1,347.60 $99.60 $1,195.20
Total, items 38-40 $4,042.80 $3,585.60
\ \
Prepared by: 2 N
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BID NO: RFQ-11-76
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN

TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #1 Bidder #2
Est. All Safe Industries Safety Products
| |Yearlyl Louisville, KY Lakeland, FL
Ommo: tion c:; oomﬁ Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
o espirator; half face, North brand only: i - o B - e
41 12 _swn::: 550030M w\E 3 $170.04
42 12|Large 550030L $14.17 $170.04
Total, ltems 40-41 $340.08
o zmmv_qmﬂo.. i Iter, full face, 3M brand only: . G
43 24|3M60923 No Bid No Bid
b xamm_.ﬁno__ filter, half face, North only: . : . Shaan
44 72 qmwov\_ 00, North, 2PC fiiters $7.95 $572.40 $6.14 $442.08/
| chestWaders, On Guard 86067 brand only: - o L
45 2i8ize 10 $118.50 $237.00 $86.00 $172.00
48 2{8ize 12 $118.50 $237.00 $86.00 $172.00
Total, ltems 45-46 $474.00 $344.00
**note below items in bold are name brand only
No substitutions
~ | Rain Coats; River City brand only, 200 Series brand: o b
47 12{Small No Bid No Bid $5.70 $68.40
48 12|Medium No Bid No Bid $5.70 $68.40
49 12|Large No Bid No Bid $5.70 $68.40
50 12{X-Large No Bid No Bid $5.70 $68.40,
51 12]2X No Bid No Bid $6.00 $72.00
52 5{3X No Bid No Bid $6.30 $31.50
53 5[4X No Bid No Bid $6.60 $33.00
54 5(6X No Bid No Bid $6.90 $34.50
) ) ) Total, Items 47-54
[ Rain suits, River City brand only, 200 Series brand: o : . :
55 12|Small No Bid No Bid $6.85 $82.20
56 12|Medium No Bid No Bid $6.85 $82.20
57 12{Large No Bid No Bid $6.85 $82.20,
58 12}X-Large No Bid No Bid $6.85 $82.20
59 12]2X No Bid No Bid $7.13 $85.56
60 5[3X No Bid No Bid $7.43 $37.15
61 54X No Bid No Bid $7.73 $38.65
62 5{5X No Bid No Bid $8.33 $41.65
Total, fems 55-62 $531.81
Delivery Time|Within 7-10 days Within 2 days

Prepared by: \\N%\\\\ \k%&“&%
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BiD NO: RFQ-11-76 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:

BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #3 Bidder #4
Est. Olympic Glove & Safety Bestway Industrial Supp!
| ___Yearly Elmwood Park, NJ Lakeland, FL

QuantiDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost,
450|Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL, 100 gloves per $5.75 $2,587.50 $6.65 $2,992.504
900|Gray shoulder gloves, split leather, palm safety cuff $0.85 $765.00 $1.85 $1,665.00
340[PVC gloves, 14" black, rough finish, Large $1.37 $465.80 $1.85 $629.00
1000{Brown knit jersey gloves $0.25 $250.00 $0.70 $700.00
Total, ltems 1-4 ) ~ $4,068.30 $5,986.50

" satety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, limegreencolor b ...

5|  50|Medium $712.50 $18.20 $910.00,
6 82(Large ' $14.25 $1,168.50 $12.80 $1,049.60
7 82|X-large $14.25 $1,168.50 $12.80 $1,049.60
8 50{2X $14.25 $712.50 $12.80 $640.00
9 10{4X $14.25 $142.50 $14.10 $141.00]
10 105X $14.26 $142.50 $18.20 $182.00,
) Total, ltems 5-10 $4,047.00 ) $3,972.20

e _Batteries, alkaline only : : . . ,
11{ 3000{AA $0.35 $1,050.00 $0.35 $1,050.00
12] 1300]AAA $0.38 $494.00 $0.35 $455.00,
13| 800|C $0.65 $520.00 $0.80 $640.00]
14 800|D $0.70 $560.00 $0.95 $760.00,
15| 500(9 voit $1.35 $675.00 $1.35 $675.00,
16| 10016 volt with spring $2.35 $235.00 $10.15 $1,015.00
Total, items 11-16 ) $3,534.00 $4,595.00

e Backsupportibrace T e el e e

17 12{Medium $13.55 $162.60 $12.60 $151.20]
18 12ilarge $13.55 $162.60 $12.60 $151.20]
19 12{XL $14.00 $168.00 $12.60 $151.20,
20 123X $14.75 $177.00 . $12.60 $151.20
Total, ltems 17-20] $670.20 $604.80)

Prepared by: \w\% m\ \“ & 4 , Date: MW.\ \mlimx




BID NO: RFQ-11-76 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #3 Bidder #4
Est. Olympic Glove & Safety Bestway Industrial Supp!
Yearly Elmwood Park, NJ Lakeland, FL
Quant Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost|
12 $18.50 $222.00 $24.50 $294.00%
22 12|Alisafe Revolution brand, black, visi n_mmﬂ or mncm_ $4.95 $59.40 $8.40 $100.801
 Gloves: o - - .
Amm mcvxmzo mo vosam.‘ free, SEC-375-XL $16.75 $2,093.75 $9.70 $1,212.50,
150{SUPRENO EC Powder free, SEC-375-XXL $16.75 $2,512.50 $9.70 $1,455.00
300|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $1.67 $501.00 $4.15 $1,245.00
300|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $1.67 $501.00 $4.15 $1,245.00
350|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $1.67 $584.50 $4.15 $1,452.50
Total, Items 23-27 ) $6,192.75 ‘am 610.00
Saba . safetyglasses: L L -
28] 144 m:.:ﬂs & <<mmmo= o_qu $5.99 $862.56 $5.50 $792.00
29| 3560{Pyramex, zone 11 $3.55 $1,242,50 $5.40 $1,890.00
Total, _nmq:m 28- Nm $2,105.06 $2,682.00
. Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only:
30 24|SIZE 8 86606 $22.50 $540.00 $16.35 $392.40
31 B0|SIZE 9 86606 $22.50 $1,350.00 $16.35 $981.00
32 60{SIZE 10 86606 $22.50 $1,350.00 $16.35 $981.00
33 60|SIZE 11 86606 $22.50 $1,350.00 $16.35 $981.00
34 60|SIZE 12 86606 $22.50 $1,350.00 $16.35 $981.00
35 48|SIZE 13 86608 $22.50 $1,080.00 $16.35 $784.80]
36 48|SIZE 14 86606 $22.50 $1,080.00 $16.35 $784.80]
Total, :m:.m uo.um ~$8,100.00 $5,886.00
; _ Hard Hat, Bullard $71 brand only: s .
37 Im_.a hat, {Full brim, white only) $11.89 $570.72 $12.70 $609.60)
- | Respirators, full face, 3M brand only: - G - S
38 12{3M 6900 Respirator, large $92.50 $1,110.00 $106.20 $1,274.40
39 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium $92.50 $1,110.00 $106.20 $1,274.40,
40 12{3M 6700 Respirator, small $92.50 $1,110,00 $106.20 $1,274.40
Total, Hems 38-40 $3,330.00 $3,823.20
Prepared by: \ \\ \k& N -~
=L 5 Date: %\ — =/




BiD NO: RFQ-11-76
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN

TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #3 Bidder #4
Est. Olympic Glove & Safety Bestway Industrial Suppl
| __|Yearly Elmwood Park, NJ Lakeland, FL
Quant|Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost,
Medium 550030M $9.85 $118.20 $11.00 $132.00
12{Large  550030L $9.85 $118.20 $11.00 $132.00
) ) Total, items 40-41 $236.40 $264.00
o _ Respirator filter, full face, 3M brand only; . Sl - . e
43|  24{3M60923 $16.25 $390.00 $19.40 $465.60
L _ Respirator filter, half face; North only: - G - . :
44)  72|7580P100, North, 2PC filters $5.90 $424.80 $3.75 $270.00]
Chest Waders, On Guard 86067 brand only. o - -
45 2|Size 10 $174.00 $101.90 $203.80,
46 2|Size 12 $87.00 $174.00 $101.90 $203.80,
Total, items 45-46 $348.00 $407.60)
**note below items in bold are name brand only
No substitutions
; _Rain Coats, River City brand only, 200 Series brand:: - - ;
47 12{Small $6.55 $78.60 $7.50 $90.00¢
48 12|Medium $6.55 $78.60 $7.50 $90.00
49 12]|Large $6.55 $78.60 $7.50 $90.00
50 12{X-Large $6.55 $78.60 $7.50 $90.00,
51 12(2X $6.85 $82.20 $8.30 $99.60)
52 513X $7.00 $35.00 $8.70 $43.50
53 514X $7.30 $36.50 $9.10 $45.50
54 515X $7.95 $39.75 $9.50 $47.50
o ) ) ] $507.85 $596.10
| Rain suits, River City brand only, 200 Series brand: - ; b o L
55 12{Small $8.15 $97.80 $9.00 $108.00
56 12{Medium $8.15 $97.80 $9.00 $108.00
57 12|Large $8.15 $97.80 $9.00 $108.00
58 12|X-L.arge $8.15 $97.80 $9.00 $108.00
59 12{2X $8.40 $100.80 $9.40 $112.80
60 513X $8.65 $43.25 $9.80 $49.00
61 54X $8.90 $44.50 $10.15 $50.75
62 518X $9.50 $47.50 $10.95 $54.75
Total, items §5-62 $627.25 $699.30
Delivery Time|Within 7 days Within 5 days
Prepared by: o
R% Nﬂ\i% 6 Date: M.i\m }\\
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BID NO: RFQ-11-76
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

N ;
S O 0N O G

11
12
13
14
15
16

17
18
19
20

Est.
Yearly]
Quant!

450
900
340
1000

50
82
82
50
10
10

3000

1300
800
800
500
100

12
12
12
12

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #5 Bidder #6
Saf-T-Glove, inc. Safety Solutions & Supp
Grand Prairie, TX Bartow, FL

Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
; Miscellaneous Gloves ; . o - -
Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL, 100 gloves per $6.85 $2,982.50 $8.58 $3,861.00
Gray shoulder gloves, spliit leather, paim safety cuff $3.75 $3,375.00 $1.43 $1,287.00
PVC gloves, 14" black, rough finish, Large $2.65 $901.00 $2.92 $992.80
Brown knit jersey gloves $0.42 $420.00 $2.03 $2,030.00
Total, items 1-4 $7,688.50 $8,170.80
_ Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color L - . L
Medium $8.31 $415.50 $10.21 $510.50,
Large $8.31 $681.42 $10.21 $837.22,
X-large $8.31 $681.42 $10.21 $837.22,
2X $8.31 $415.50 $10.21 $510.50!
4x $8.31 $83.10 $10.21 $102.10,
5X $8.31 $83.10 $10.21 $102.101
_ Total, Items 5-10] $2,360.04 $2,899.64
Batteries, alkalineonly = o o E S - ;
AA $0.62 $1,860.00 $0.42 $1,260.00,
AAA $0.62 $806.00 $0.41 $533.00
C $1.29 $1,032.00 $0.76 $608.00
D $1.55 $1,240.00 $0.91 $728.00,
9 volt $2.51 $1,2565.00 $1.46 $730.00]
6 volt with spring $10.70 $1,070.00 $39.80 $3,980.00]
- ; ~ Total, Items 11-16 $7,263.00 $7,849.00)
 Back'supportibrace e e
Medium $80.40 $143.28
Large $6.70 $80.40 $11.94 $143.28
XL $6.70 $80.40 $11.81 $141.72
3X $6.70 $80.40 $11.81 $141.72
Total, Items 17-20| $321.60 $570.00

7 Date: M\\Wﬁ.&\\




BID NO: RFQ-11-76
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

Prepared by: .\& N N\W
e

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #5 Bidder #6
Est. Saf-T-Glove, inc. Safety Solutions & Supp
|| Yearly] Grand Prairie, TX Bartow, FL
gitem 0cm2 meo%:o: Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
21 12 _so_n_mx mvm_‘x Plugs #mmma or mncm_. 100 pairs per box $20.00 $240.00 $27.52 $330.24]
1 _DustGoggles: s e ‘ -
22|  12|Alisafe Revolution brand, black, visi clear or equal $8.13 $97.56 $0.90 $10.808
23| 125 mcvzmzo mn powder :69 wmn.uqm.x_l No Bid No Bid $9.42 $1,177.50
24] 150{SUPRENO EC Powder free, SEC-375-XXL No Bid No Bid $9.42 $1,413.00
25| 300|Drivers gioves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $2.99 $897.00 $23.47 $7,041.00
26| 300|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $2.99 $897.00 $23.47 $7,041.00
27| 350|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $3.20 $1,120.00 $23.47 $8,214.50
Total, items 23-27 incomplete $24,887.00
28| 144 w:::. m. Wesson, clear $5.82 $838.08 $5.77 $830.88;
29| 350]|Pyramex, zone 11 $3.03 $1,060.50 No Bid No Bid
Total, :oz,.m 28- Nw $1,898.58 Incomplete
: _ Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only:
30| 24[SIZE 8 86606 No Bid No Bid $15.25 $366.00]
31 B0{SIZE 9 86606 No Bid No Bid $15.25 $915.00]
32} 60|SIZE 10 86606 No Bid No Bid $15.25 $915.00]
33| 60|{SIZE 11 86606 No Bid No Bid $15.256 $915.00
34| 60{SIZE 12 86606 No Bid No Bid $15.25 $915.00
35| 48|SIZE 13 86606 No Bid No Bid $15.26 $732.00
36| 48[SIZE 14 86606 No Bid No Bid $15.25 $732.00
Total, ltems wo 36 $5,490.004
o | Hard Hat, Bullard $71 brand only: ; o L
37 48{Hard :mr =u== brim, white only)} No Bid $658.56
m.lm:ﬁo_.m_ full face, 3M brand o:_< v o L \ o
12 a_s 6900 Respirator, large $106.29 $1,275.48 $111.36 $1,336.32
12|3M 6800 Respirator, medium $106.29 $1,275.48 $111.36 $1,336.32
12{3M 6700 Respirator, small $106.29 $1,276.48 $111.36 $1,336.32
Total, items 38-40 $3,826.44 «.rooa.wa—
8 Date: \ﬂ /5 —//



BID NO: RFQ-11-76 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:

BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #5 Bidder #6
Est. Saf-T-Glove, inc. Safety Solutions & Supp
||<mm1< Grand Prairie, TX Bartow, FL
Quant]| Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
___Respirator, half face, North brand only: ... =
12{Medium 550030M $20.77 $249.24 $9.22 $110.64;
12{Large 5500301 $20.77 $249.24 $9.22 $110.64
o Total, items 40-41 )  $498.48 ) $221.28
. | | Respimatorfilter, full face, 3Mbrandonly: | oo 2 .
43 24|3M60923 $17.95 $430.80 $18.79 $450.96
e _Respirator filter, haif face, North only: e L - b e
44|  72{7580P100, North, 2PC filters $6.33 $455.76 $5.62 $404.64
L. | chestWaders, On Guard:86067 brand only: o -
45 2|Size 10 No Bid $101.83 $203.66,
46 2|Size 12 No Bid No Bid $101.83 $203.66
Total, items 45-46 $407.32
**note below items in bold are name brand only
No substitutions
© | | Rain Coats; River City brand only; 200 Series bra - ... === b - :
47 12{Small $6.12 $73.44 $7.20 $86.40
48 12|Medium $6.12 $73.44 $7.20 $86.40
49 12|Large $6.12 $73.44 $7.20 $86.40
50 12{X-Large $6.12 $73.44 $7.20 $86.40
51 12{2X $6.37 $76.44 $7.58 $90.96
52 5/3X $6.61 $33.06 $7.96 $39.80
53 54X $7.05 $356.25 $8.33 $41.65
54 515X $7.41 $37.05 $8.70 $43.50
) ) ) ) Total, ltems 47-54 ) - $475.55 $561.51
| | Rainsuits, River City brand only, 200 Seriesbrand; = =~ = .
55 12{Small $7.59 $91.08 $103.56
56 12{Medium $7.59 $91.08 $8.63 $103.56
57 12|Large $7.59 $91.08 $8.63 $103.56
58 12{X-Large $7.59 $91.08 $8.63 $103.56
59 12[2X $8.03 $96.36 $9.00 $108.00
60 5/3X $8.32 $41.60 $9.38 $46.90)
61 514X $8.63 $43.15 $9.76 $48.80
62 5|6X No Bid No Bid $10.50 $52.50)
Total, Items 55-62 Incomplete $670.44
Delivery Time|Within 7 days

i

Prepared by: x%@\m §\®% 9 Date: .mwmxs\\ﬂk\,\\



BID NO: RFQ-11-76 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:

BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #7 Bidder #8
Est. Fastenal Company Interboro Packaging Cor
|__|Yearly Auburndale, FL Montgomery, NY
Iter Quanti Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost;
L 1. MiscellaneousGloves: = . L. b _ e  —~~ ~=% %>
1| 450]Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL, 100 gloves per $6.74 $3,033.00 $5.80 $2,610.00
2| 900]{Gray shoulder gloves, split leather, palm safety cuff $1.74 $1,566.00 No Bid No Bi
3] 340|PVC gloves, 14" black, rough finish, Large $2.20 $748.00 No Bid i
4| 1000{Brown knit jersey gloves $1.09 $1,090.00 No Bid
) ) Total, ltems 1-4 $6,437.00
| safetyvests, Class 3only, with pockets; lime greencolor =~ e ;
5 50| Medium $14.40 $720.00 No Bid
6| 82|Large $14.40 $1,180.80 No Bid
7 82| Xlarge $14.40 $1,180.80 No Bid
8} 50{2X $14.40 $720.00 No Bid
9 10{4X $14.40 $144.00 No Bid
10 10[5X No Bid No Bid No Bid
) ) Total, Items m.u.o_ ) Incomplete
£l ' patteries, alkalineonyy . .}
11| 3000|AA $0.27 $810.00
12| 1300{AAA : $0.24 $312.00 No Bid
131 800|C $0.73 $584.00 No Bid
14{ 800|D $0.99 $792.00 No Bid
15| 500{9 voit $1.11 $555.00 No Bid
16| 10016 volt with spring $2.35 $235.00 No Bid
’ - Total, s 11-16 $3,288.00
e _ Back support/brace S - .
17 12{Medium $10.15 $121.80 No Bid
18 12|Large $10.15 $121.80 No Bid
19 12{XL $10.00 $120.00 No Bid
20 12[3X No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total, items ‘_q.nc_ Incomplete

. e
rropsred by & RW\Q\Q&\\\M\ 10 Date: w\s\ \v\x - \\




BID NO: RFQ-11-76
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN

TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #7 Bidder #8
Est. Fastenal Company Interboro Packaging Cor
| __{Yearly| Auburndale, FL Montgomery, NY
fiterrtQuant Ummo%zo: Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
21 12 Z_o_amx m_om..x _u_cmm &wmmu or mn_cm_ 100 pairs per _uox $23.52 $282.24 No Bid No bid
k] . . DustG mm es: e . -
22 12 >_.mmﬁm mm<o_5_o: brand, black, visi clear or equal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bidj
b _Gloves: . L S o :
23| 125 mcvxmzo EC powder free, wmo-wqm.x_. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24| 150[SUPRENO EC Powder free, SEC-375-XXL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
25| 300|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $6.48 $1,944.00 No Bid No Bid
26| 300|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $6.48 $1,944.00 No Bid No Bid
27| 350|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $6.83 $2,390.50 No Bid No Bid
Total, :35 Nw mw Incomplete
o _ Safety glasses: o : L
28| 144 m:::.. & Wesson, clear No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
29} 350{Pyramex, zone 11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total, Items nm nc
_ Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand on
30| 24 m_Nm 8 86606 $16.11 $386.64 No Bid No Bid
31 60|SIZE 9 86606 $16.11 $966.60 No Bid No Bid
32} 60|SIZE 10 86606 $16.11 $966.60 No Bid No Bid
33 60|SIZE 11 86606 $16.11 $966.60 No Bid No Bid
34 B0|SIZE 12 86606 $16.11 $966.60 No Bid No Bid
35| 48[SIZE 13 86606 $16.11 $773.28 No Bid No Bid
36 48{SIZE 14 86606 $16.90 $811.20 No Bid No Bid
R Total, :m:.m 30-36
o  Hard Hat, Bullard $71 brand o:_<. i | e G
37 48|Hard :mﬁ (Full brim, white only) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bidj
 Respirators, full face, 3M brand only: o ; - =
3M mcco Respirator, large $139.59 $1,675.08 No Bid No Bid
3M 6800 Respirator, medium $139.59 $1,675.08 No Bid No Bid
3M 6700 Respirator, small $139.59 $1,675.08 No Bid No Bid
Total, ltems 38-40 $5,025.24

Prepared by:

%mw R x %\\%\
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Date:
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BID NO: RFQ-11-76

BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

Est.
Yearly]

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies

Bidder #7
Fastenal Company
Auburndate, FL

Bidder #8
Interbore Packaging Cor
Montgomery, NY

Quant

41| 12

Medium 550030M

Description ;
. Respirator, half face, North br:

donly:

12|Large

550030L

43

1 Respiratorfilter, full face, 30 brand only:

Total, Items 40-41

Unit Cost

$12.40

$23.57

$12.40

Total Cost
$148.80
$148.80
$297.60

| $565.68

Unit Cost

No Bid

Ne Bid

Total Cost

No Bid|

2413M60923
1 Respirator filter, half face, North only: L - o i
44 72{7580P100, North, 2PC filters $7.26 $522.72 No Bid No Bidj
' ChestWaders, Oh Guard 86067 brand only:. . . e o ,
2|Size 10 $105.68 $211.36 No Bid No Bid
2|8ize 12 $105.68 $211.36 No Bid No Bid
Total, items 45-46 $422.72
**note below items in bold are name brand only
| RainCoats; 200 Series bran, ; o |
12iSmall $6.27 $75.24 No Bid No Bid
12iMedium $6.32 $75.84 No Bid No Bid
12{Large $6.37 $76.44 No Bid No Bid
12{X-Large $6.53 $78.36 No Bid No Bid
12]2X $6.83 $81.96 No Bid No Bid
5{3X $7.13 $35.85 No Bid No Bid
514X $7.36 $36.80 No Bid No Bid
5{6X $7.58 $37.90 No Bid No Bid
) ) ) Total, Items 47-54 $498.19
|« | Rainsuits, River City brand only, 200 Series brand: . o L -
55 12{Small $6.90 $82.80 No Bid
56 12|Medium $6.90 $82.80 No Bid No Bid
57 12|Large $7.00 $84.00 No Bid No Bid
58 12|X-Large $7.10 $85.20 No Bid No Bid
59 12|2X $7.20 $86.40 No Bid No Bid
60 5[3X $7.50 $37.50 No Bid No Bid
61 54X $7.90 $39.50 No Bid No Bid|
62 515X $8.40 $42.00 No Bid No Bid
Total, items 55-62 $540.20
Delivery Time|Within 5-7 days Within 7 days

LY

Prepared by: K\W\

S

/
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Date: N\..\y\h\m,% \\




BID NO: RFQ-11-76
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

i
12
13
14
15
16

17
18
19
20

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #9 Bidder #
Est, American Discount Pharmacy
Yearly| Immokalee, FL
QuantiDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost|
1777 77 Wiscellaneous Gloves: . . ]
Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL, 100 gloves pe $3.80 $1,710.00
Gray shoulder gloves, split leather, paim safety cuff $1.25 $1,125.00
PVC gloves, 14" black, rough finish, Large $2.59 $880.60
Brown knit jersey gloves $0.75 $750.00
Total, items 1-4 $4,465.60
. Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets; lime green color o
Medium $10.50 $525.00
Large $10.50 $861.00
X-large $10.50 $861.00
2X $10.50 $525.00
4X $10.50 $105.00
5X $10.50 $105.00
, Total, Items 5-10] $2,982.00
F . Batteries, alkalineonly o ; a L
3000{AA $0.30 $900.00
1300|AAA $0.32 $416.00
800|C $0.70 $560.00
800{D $0.80 $640.00
5009 volt $1.21 $605.00
1006 volt with spring $2.00 $200.00
Total, items 11-16 $3,321.00
b Back support/ brace L ; : L
12{Medium $7.00 $84.00
12iLarge $7.00 $84.00
12{XL $7.00 $84.00
123X $7.00 $84.00
Total, ltems 17-20] $336.00

Prepared by: \ﬁ“« \%\ % \\@0\\\%‘*‘%

13
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BID NO: RFQ-11-76 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:

BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #9 Bidder #
Est. American Discount Pharmacy
|| Yearly] Immokalee, FL

Quant Ommoz tion Unit Cost Unit Cost

Total Cost Total Cost|

$300.00

, 22 , 12 >=wm$ Revolution brand, black, visi clear or equal ; wu.oo . a._ow.ce

b e Gloves: e [ -
23] 125 mc_uwmzo EC powder free, mmn.wqm.xu‘ No Bid No Bid
24} 150{SUPRENO EC Powder free, SEC-375-XXL No Bid No Bid
25| 300{Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $2.20 $660.00
26{ 300{Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $2.20 $660.00
27| 350|Drivers gloves, unlined, 100% leather, Style No-368 $2.20 $770.00
._.oS_. Items 23-27 ) ~Incomplete
oL Safetyglasses: b o . .
28| 144 m:::_ u. Emmmos_ clear $6.00 $864.00
29| 350[Pyramex, zone 11 No Bid No Bid
._,o»m_‘ items 28-29 Incomplete

' Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only:
30 24 w_Nm 8 86606 $15.25 $366.00
31 60|SIZE 9 86606 $15.25 $915.00
32| 60{SIZE 10 86606 $15.25 $916.00
33 60|SIZE 11 86606 $15.25 $915.00
34 60(SIZE 12 86606 $15.25 $915.00
35 48|SIZE 13 86606 $15.25 $732.00
36 48|SIZE 14 86606 $156.25 $732.00
y

35

490.00|

i . Hard Imv Bullard $71 brand. only: i . G .
37 48 :ma :mn {Full brim, white only) $12.15 $583.20

| Respirators, full'face, 3V brand only: .. =~ = = = == @
3M 6900 Respirator, large $118.00 $1,416.00

3M 6800 Respirator, medium $118.00 $1,416.00
3M 6700 Respirator, small $118.00 $1,416.00
Total, items 38-40 $4,248.00

Prepared by &x’%\%\m\\\\m\t \ 14 Date: M\ ‘z\xﬂ\:z. 4 \
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BID NO: RFQ-11-76
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 08/10/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN

TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #9 Bidder #
Est. American Discount Pharmacy
___{Yearlyl Immokalee, FL
E Quant{Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 1 Respirator, half face, North brand only: - — : :
41 12{Medium 550030M $10.00 $120.00
42 12[Large 550030L No Bid No Bid
o Total, Items 40-41) Incomplete
.| Respirator filter, full face; 3M brand only: = o o
43 2413M60923 $12.00 $288.00
- || Respiratorfilter, half face, Northonly: *= . _
44 7217580P100, North, 2PC filters $7.80 $561.60
; Chest Waders, On Guard 86067 brand only: , L
45 2|Size 10 $132.00 $264.00
46 2|Size 12 $132.00 $264.00
Total, items 45-46 $528.00
**note below items in bold are name brand only
No substitutions
|| RainCoats, River City brand only, 200 Series brand: | ]
47 12{Small No Bid
48 12{Medium $10.00 $120.00
49 12llarge $10.00 $120.00
50 12|X-Large $10.00 $120.00
51 12|2X $10.00 $120.00
52 5|3X $12.00 $60.00
53 5/4X $13.00 $65.00
54 5[6X $13.00 $65.00
. ) ) ltems 47-54 Incomplete
| Rain suits, River City brand only, 200 Series brand: |
12{8mall $120.00
12|Medium $10.00 $120.00
12|Large $10.00 $120.00
12|X-Large $10.00 $120.00
12]2X $10.00 $120.00
5[3X $11.00 $55.00
514X $12.00 $60.00
5{5X $13.00 $65.00
Total, ltems 55-62 $780.00

Delivery Time

Within 5 days

Prepared by: \\\ & § \N\W \%
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