BID NO RFQ-11-32 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO:
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 02/23/11 TABULATION OF BIDS
Repair or Replace 40 HP Inverter Bidder No 1 Bidder No 2
Motor BOI Amher Corp
Strafford, CT St Petersburg, FL
fitem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
A Repair existing motor No Bid No Bid $3,810.00 $3,810.001
B Replace with new motor $4,447.00 $4,447.00 No Bid No Bidg
Delivery time|Within 10 days Within 10 days
Repair or Replace 40 HP Inverter Bidder No 3 Bidder No 4
Motor Applied Industrial Technologies Flanders Electric Motor
Lakeland, FL Lakeland, FL
flitem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
A Repair existing motor No Bid No Bid $2,987.00 $2,987.00|
2] Replace with new motor $3,879.00 $3,879.00 $3,481.00 $3,481.000
** plus freight
Delivery time |Within 4 days Within 14 days
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BID NO RFQ-11-32
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 02/23/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

Repair or Replace 40 HP Inverter
Motor

Bidder No 5
Central Electric Motor Service
Haines City, FL

Bidder No 6
Process Equipment Repair
Tampa, FL

glitem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
A 1|Repair existing motor $1,681.28 $1,681.28 $1,885.00 $1,885.008
B 1|Replace with new motor $4,683.00 $4,683.00 $5,075.00 $5,075.00
Delivery time|Within 14 days Within 1-5 days
Repair or Replace 40 HP Inverter Bidder No 7 Bidder No 8
Motor Florida Armature Works Florida Electric Service
Kissimmee, FL Orlando, FL
ditem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
A 1|Repair existing motor $1,860.00 $1,860.00 $1,325.00 $1,325.001
B 1]Replace with new motor $5,276.25 $5,276.25 $3,995.00 $3,995.001
Delivery time|Within 84 days Within 3-5 days
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BID NO RFQ-11-32
BID OPENING 2:00 P.M., 02/23/11

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO:

\\\ \ /

Repair or Replace 40 HP Inverter Bidder No 9 Bidder No 10
Motor Stewart's Electric Motor Works Wateronics Technical
Orlando, FL Melbourne, FL
flitem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price|
A 1|Repair existing motor $2,794.20 $2,794.20 $2,480.00 $2,480.008
iB 1]Replace with new motor $4,289.77 $4,289.77 $4,760.00 $4,760.00F
Delivery time|Within 7-10 days Within 14 days
Repair or Replace 40 HP Inverter Bidder No Bidder No
Motor
fltem Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
A 1IRepair existing motor
B 1]Replace with new motor
Delivery time
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