BID NO: RFQ-11-09 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 11/05/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO 1 BIDDER NO 2
Hardware Banner Works of Florida Fast Signs
Sanford, FL Brandon, FL
HITEN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100]18"x36" Banners (1-100) $35.74 $3,574.00 $21.55 $2,155.00
1 200{18"36" Banners (101-200) $32.55 $6,510.00 $19.05 $3,810.00
1 300§18"x36" Banners (201-300) $32.55 $9,765.00 $16.55 $4,965.00
2 25]24"x72" Banners (10-25) $71.54 $1,788.50 $48.70 $1,217.50
3 5013'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $78.00 $3,900.00 $65.20 mw.mmo.oo—
3(d) 5013'x5' Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $136.50 $6,825.00 $113.95 $5,697.50
4 40|Banner mounting hardware kits $85.85 $3,434.00 $72.00 $2,880.001
(30-40)
Delivery Time|Within 30 days Within 30 days
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO 3 BIDDER NO 4
Hardware Clark Sales & Display AGAS MFG
Tavares, FL. Philadelphia, PA
IITEN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100|18"x36" Banners (1-100) $55.00 $5,500.00 $65.00 $6,500.00
1 200118"36" Banners (101-200) $31.25 $6,250.00 $58.00 $11,600.00
1 300}18"x36" Banners (201-300) $30.00 $9,000.00 $48.00 $14,400.00
2 25]24"x72" Banners (10-25) $57.50 $1,437.50 $97.00 $2,425.000
3 50{3'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $31.25 $1,562.50 $27.94 ﬁ_wmﬂoo_
3(d) 5013'x5’ Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $31.25 $1,562.50 $55.84 $2,792.00
4 40{Banner mounting hardware kits $80.00 $3,200.00 *$100.00 $4,000.00
(30-40)
*plus screen print charges & freight charges *Item 4 price for bracket for banner to hang one side $84.00
Delivery Time|Within 21 days _ _
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BID NO: RFQ-11-09 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 11/05/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDERNO 5 BIDDER NO 6
Hardware Rock Bridge Media Four Seasons Banner
Huntsville, AL Port Orange, FL
HITEN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100§18"x36" Banners (1-100) $35.00 $3,500.00 $38.00 $3,800.00
1 200} 18"36" Banners (101-200) $30.00 $6,000.00 $37.00 $7,400.00
1 300{18"x36" Banners (201-300) $28.00 $8,400.00 $36.00 $10,800.00
2 25{24"x72" Banners (10-25) $60.00 $1,500.00 $78.00 $1,950.00]
3 50|3'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $45.00 $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid
3(d) 5013'x5' Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $22.00 $1,100.00 No Bid No Bid
4 40{Banner mounting hardware kits $45.00 $1,800.00 $52.00 $2,080.000
(30-40)
Delivery Time|Within 20 days Within 60 days
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDERNO 7 BIDDER NO 8
Hardware Carrot-Top Industries, Inc. PRIDE Enterprises
Hillsborough, NC St Petersburg, FL
hireN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100}18"x36" Banners (1-100) $56.16 $5,616.00 $41.40 $4,140.00
1 200118"36" Banners (101-200) $42.10 $8,420.00 $21.15 $4,230.00
1 300}18"x36" Banners (201-300) $37.82 $11,346.00 $21.15 $6,345.00
2 25124"x72" Banners (10-25) $82.89 $2,072.25 $54.90 $1,372.50
3 50]3'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $56.80 $2,840.00 No Bid No Bid
3(d) 50{3'x5" Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $72.20 $3,610.00 No Bid No Bid
4 40|Banner mounting hardware kits $32.13 $1,285.20 $59.69 $2,387.60
(30-40)
Delivery Time|Within 21 days Within 30 days
/
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BID NO: RFQ-11-09 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 11/05/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO 9 BIDDER NO 10
Hardware CVSFlags.com Liberty Flags
Marion, IN Tulsa, OK
HITEN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100{18"x36" Banners (1-100) $51.19 $5,119.00 No Bid No Bid
1 200]18"36" Banners (101-200) $43.38 $8,676.00 No Bid No Bid
1 300(18"x36" Banners (201-300) $40.73 $12,219.00 No Bid No Bid
2 25]24"x72" Banners (10-25) $72.41 $1,810.25 No Bid No Bid|
3 50{3'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $28.47 $1,423.50 $22.00 $1,100.00
3(d) 50(3'x5" Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $57.41 $2,870.50 $49.00 $2,450.00
4 40(Banner mounting hardware kits $75.50 $3,020.00 No Bid No Bidj
(30-40)
Delivery Time|Within 21-35 days Within 30 days
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO 11 BIDDER NO 12
Hardware CDI Enterprises Flag World, inc.
Pompano Beach, FL Orlando, FL
hTeN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100{18"x36" Banners (1-100) $34.00 $3,400.00 $70.00 $7,000.00
1 200}18"36" Banners (101-200) $33.00 $6,600.00 $60.00 $12,000.00
1 300} 18"x36" Banners (201-300) $32.00 $9,600.00 $58.00 $17,400.00
2 25124"x72" Banners (10-25) $55.00 $1,375.00 $93.00 $2,325.00)
3 50|3'%x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $120.00 $6,000.00 $40.75 No Bid
3(d) 50|3'x5' Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $120.00 $6,000.00 $78.00 No Bid
4 40|Banner mounting hardware kits $43.00 $1,720.00 $98.00 $3,920.00]
(30-40)
Delivery Time{Within 21 days Within 20 days
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BID NO: RFQ-11-09 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 11/05/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO 13 BIDDER NO 14
Hardware Con Serv Flag Company Design Decorators, Inc.
Sidney, NE Philadelphia, PA
HITEN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100 18"x36" Banners (1-100) $24.89 $2,489.00 $24.90 $2,490.00
1 200]18"36" Banners (101-200) $19.95 $3,990.00 $24.90 $4,980.00
1 300)18"x36" Banners (201-300) $16.95 $5,085.00 $24.90 $7,470.00
2 25124"x72" Banners (10-25) $56.95 $1,423.75 $55.00 $1,375.00
3 50{3'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $39.00 $1,950.00 $73.73 mw,mmm.mo—
3(d) 5013'x5" Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $69.00 $3,450.00 $83.45 $4,172.50
4 40}Banner mounting hardware kits $58.00 $2,320.00 $49.00 $1,960.00
(30-40)
Delivery Time|Within 30 days Within 30 days
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO 15 BIDDER NO 16
Hardware Project Graphics Metro Flag Co
South Burlington, VT Dover, NJ
fiTen DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100]18"x36" Banners (1-100) $26.75 $2,675.00 $51.70 $5,170.00
1 200]18"36" Banners (101-200) $23.85 $4,770.00 $49.85 $9,970.00
1 300|18"x36" Banners (201-300) $21.85 $6,555.00 $48.70 $14,610.00
2 25124"x72" Banners (10-25) $56.00 $1,400.00 $113.10 No Bidy
3 5013'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $27.45 $1,372.50 $29.25 No Bid
3(d) 50|3'x5' Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $32.50 $1,625.00 $56.65 No Bid
4 40|Banner mounting hardware kits $54.50 $2,180.00 No Bid No Bidil
(30-40)
*size 18"x 72
Delivery Time{Within 21 days Within 30 days




BID NO: RFQ-11-09 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
DATE CLOSED: 2:00 P.M., 11/05/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO 17 BIDDER NO
Hardware Freedom Flag & Banner Co.
N. Miami, FL.
HITEN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100]18"x36" Banners (1-100) $69.00 $6,900.00
1 200}18"36" Banners (101-200) $69.00 $13,800.00
1 300}18"x36" Banners (201-300) $57.50 $17,250.00
2 25(24"x72" Banners (10-25) $139.00 $3,475.00
3 50|3'x5' Nylon Flag (20-50) $29.50 $1,475.00
3(d) 50}3'x5" Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50) $75.00 $3,750.00
4 40|Banner mounting hardware kits $75.00 $3,000.00
(30-40)
*ltem #1 quoted 51-100
Delivery Time|Within 14-21 days
Banners, Flags & Mounting BIDDER NO BIDDER NO
Hardware
HITEN DESCRIPTION Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 100{18"x36" Banners (1-100)
1 200}18"36" Banners (101-200)
1 300}18"x36" Banners (201-300)
2 25124"'x72" Banners (10-25)
3 50(3'%x5' Nylon Fiag (20-50)
3(d) 50]3'x5' Nylon Flag, 2-sided (20-50)
4 40|Banner mounting hardware kits
(30-40)
Delivery Time
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