BID NO: RFQ-11-04

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/15/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AL | s

(5 A by He§ AWARDED TO
PRV I W R b
et 2 -t 19

(ke 5
8-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #1 / Ly L Fm e S
Early Janitorial Early Janitorial A m.ﬁ\,.\ﬁ?ﬁ m
Lakeland, FL Lakeland, FL L R /
fitem | Quant jDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost] A\M; Q\«a\mﬂh mu %\HMWU \\ n\
1 25{Wasp Spray, Zenkill Il Long Shot, No Substitutions $57.00 $1,425.00 No bid NO bid e
2 5|Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal $48.60 $243.00 No bid No bid ,st\ % - umum' \ o
Brand bid Raid .EW%\S\S
3 5|Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal $39.60 $198.00 No bid No bid S,
Brand bid Champion \N%e % 7 - iuw\ i5
4 ~+:70{Clorox Green Works, No Substitutions $6.04 $422.80 No bid No bid :
5 | 53|Toilet Bowl Cieaner, Misty Bolex BL0925 or equal $2.30 $121.90 $2.45 $129.85 :mu\\g\ %&z\ \ e
Brand bid Theochem Misty Bolex (M\H%ﬂ
6 15]Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal $4.99 $74.85 $6.64 $99.60
Brand bid Theochem Misty iﬁi @ f&
7 8| Clear plastic cups, Boardwalk BWKYEQ9 or equal $53.95 $323.70 No bid No bid z%\dm.%w\@
Brand bid Boardwalk BWKYEQ9 o
8 28{Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case $29.93 $838.04 No bid No bid F@A\g&u\w\ ! 0- 5(\ ﬁaw
Brand bid Early Janitorial \uﬁ\
9 32|Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mill, black 250 per case $25.52 $816.64 No bid No bid J.\\‘TMEMW\ m
Brand bid Early Janitorial ) F &
10 | 151|Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case $28.70 $4,333.70 No bid No bid gé@ (3 ﬁﬁ% 0
Brand bid Early Janitorial o m,~\
11 54| Paper towels, white, multifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal $22.13 $1,195.02 $18.99 $1,025.46 zw.,\qw.ﬁwﬁ\r!\mmh { kw mmm o
Brand bid General &mmw / &m - mwu @?
12 100{Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal $28.11 $2,811.00 $18.76 $1,875.00 g oy Q
Brand bid Boardwalk BWK6200 Green Source {
13 22|Paper towels, Wypallx60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions $74.52 $1,639.44 f%\g\p .%nmkm m n&m w\‘\mﬁ\ %w@
14 50| Toilet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal $32,90 $1,645.00 $32.55 $1,627.50 \ﬁ% ) a\m% \. \® T
Brand bid Green Heritage #276 Green Source -3 o \,.%\ 5
15 118| Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9", 2-ply, 12 rolls per case $19.50 $2,301.00 No bid No bid %%X m\ﬁ.\tmw m. \w e
Brand bid General Ultra wmw i fw
16 225{Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal $6.20 $1,395.00 No bid No bid N\m. .Nﬁ\ﬁmw m % ?m.
Brand bid Early Janitorial Qm\h
17 23|Cups, hot/cold coffee, Dart Joup or equal $24.38 $560.74 No bid No bid @\wv zmnr\ m@ - ﬁ.mm
Brand bid Dart ..mxv
18 3{Hand sanitary wipes, Wypall 81371, No Substitutions $63.00 $189.00 No bid No bid %&&w % \w
19 88| Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions $53.09 $4,671.92 erz
20 18]Cooler, 5-galion, Igloo, No Substitutions $37.15 $668.70 No bid No bid
21 10{Cooler, 2-galion, Igloo, No Substitutions $25.60 $256.00 No bid No bit
22 12{Hand soap, heavy duty cleaner, Tropic Orange or equal $11.44 $137.28 No bid No bi
Brand bid Fast Orange x
23 10{Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions $22.32 $223.20 No bid No bi ‘ (W\ﬁ Mw Jt
24 125{Bleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal $2.32 $290.00 $1.98 $247.50 MM\\%%\\E - xuwum\ { wm.
Brand bid Clorox Snowee Austin 1 gal § ,mqm 2o (L
25 100|Time mist spray, or equal, 7 oz cans $4.00 $400.00 No bid No bi fm\ ﬁw@ \MA\
Brand bid Time Mist mw\\@ﬁ &
26 2jKitchen roll towels, L-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions $21.21 $42.42 No bid &&ob\%!wm
Delivery Time|Within 5 days Within 5 days
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BID NO: RFQ-11-04
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/16/10

Prepared by

s
Vo 1 vd

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

6-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #3 Bidder #4
E & W Tool Safety Products
Mulberry, FL Lakeland, FL
[tem | Quant ! Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Costy
1 251Wasp Spray, Zenkill il Long Shot, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid No bid
2 5}Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal $42.95 $214.75 No bid No bid
Brand bid DRK 94400
3 5] Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal $68.20 $341.00 No bid No bid
Brand bid Lysol 4650
4 701Clorox Green Works, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid No bid
5 53| Toilet Bowl Cleaner, Misty Bolex BL0925 or equal $2.15 $113.95 No bid No bid
Brand bid Misty 925-12
6 151Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal $10.92 $163.80 No bid No bid
Brand bid DRT80940
7 6|Clear plastic cups, Boardwalk BWKYEOQD or equal No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid
8 28| Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid
9 32| Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mill, black 250 per case No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid
10 151} Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid
1 54| Paper towels, white, multifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid
12 100|Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid
13 22|Paper towels, Wypalix60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions No Bid No bid $47.40 $1,042.80
14 50| Toilet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal $32.40 $1,620.00 No bid No bid
Brand bid BWK 6180
16 118 Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9", 2-ply, 12 rolls per case $25.19 $2,972.42 No bid No bid
Brand bid FTH 13702
16 225]Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid
17 23{Cups, hot/cold coffee, Dart Jcup or equal $21.48 $494.04 No bid No bid
Brand bid Dart
18 3|Hand sanitary wipes, Wypall 91371, No Substitutions $64.50 $193.50 $39.80 $119.40
19 88} Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions $48.00 $4,224.00 $44.19 $3,888.72
20 18} Cooler, 5-gallon, igioo, No Substitutions $32.06 $577.08 $30.23 $544.14
21 10]Cooler, 2-gallon, Igloo, No Substitutions $20.96 $209.60 $22.19 $221.90
22 12]Hand soap, heavy duty cleaner, Tropic Orange or equal No Bid No bid $66.30 $795.60
Brand bid GOJO
23 10{Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid No bid}|
24 125|Bleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal $1.40 $175,00
Brand bid
25 100]| Time mist spray, or equal, 7 0z cans $3.31 $331.00 No bid No bid
Brand bid
26 2 |Kitchen roll towels, L-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid No bid
Delivery Time Within 2 days
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BID NO: RFQ-11-04 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/15/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
6-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #5 Bidder #6
GLT Total Office Cohesive Enterprise
Lakeland, FL Alford, FL.
fitem |Quant i Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cosil
1 25|Wasp Spray, Zenkill 1ll Long Shot, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid No bidg
2 5{Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal $43.47 $217.35 $43.55 $217.75
Brand bid DRK 94400 Johnson Diversity
3 5|Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal $51.64 $258.20 $40.20 $201.00
Brand bid AMR A22120 Clorox
4 70{Clorox Green Works, No Substitutions $4.99 $349.30 No bid No bidf
5 53| Toilet Bowl Cleaner, Misty Bolex BL0925 or equal $2.16 $114.48 $2.75 $145.75
Brand bid AMR R92512 3M
6 15{Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal $4.99 $74.85 No bid No bid
Brand bid (4002102
7 6| Clear plastic cups, Boardwalk BWKYEQS or equal $47.67 $286.02 $49.05 $294.30
Brand bid BWK YE-9 Dart
8 28|Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case No Bid No bid $15.95 $446.60
Brand bid Boardwalk 24322
9 32| Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mill, black 250 per case $26.38 $844.16 $16.95 $542.40,
Brand bid JAGR3339HH Boardwalk 3334M
10 161|Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case $21.83 $3,296.33 $15.85 $2,393.35
Brand bid PNL523 Penny Lane
11 54 Paper towels, white, muitifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal $19.94 $1,076.76 $20.05 $1,082.70
Brand bid BWK 6200 Boardwalk 6200
12 100{Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal $16.41 $1,641.00 $22.50 $2,250.00!
Brand bid GEN350HN Boardwalk 6252
13 22| Paper towels, Wypallx60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions $84.18 $1,851.96 No bid No bidg
14 50| Toilet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal $31.06 $1,553.00 $33.75 $1,687.50
Brand bid APM 276 Atlas Paper
15 118 Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9", 2-ply, 12 rolls per case $13.58 $1,602.44 $26.05 $3,073.90
Brand bid GEN ULTRAS Boardwalk 6100
16 225} Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal No Bid No bid $26.10 $5,872.50
Brand bid Unisen UNS
17 23| Cups, hot/cold coffee, Dart Jeup or equal $19.99 $459.77 $27.05 $622.15
Brand bid DRC 12017 Dart
18 3{Hand sanitary wipes, Wypall 91371, No Substitutions $61.61 $184.83 $59.60 $178.80
19 88|Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid No bid
20 18| Cooler, 5-galion, Igloo, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid
21 10| Cooler, 2-galion, Igloo, No Substitutions No Bid No bid No bid
22 12]Hand soap, heavy duty cleaner, Tropic Orange or equal No Bid No bid $62.50 $750.00
Brand bid GOJO
23 10]Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions $20.40 $204.00 No bid No bid
24 125{Bleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal $1.72 $215.00 $14.75 $1,843.75
Brand bid KIK BLEACH 6 Clorox
25 100{Time mist spray, or equal, 7 oz cans No Bid No bid $8.50 $850.00,
Brand bid Time Mist
26 21Kitchen roll towels, L.-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions $20.40 $40.80 No bid No bi
Delivery Time|Within 2-3 days Within 7 days
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BID NO: RFQ-11-04 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/15/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
8-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #7 Bidder #8
Big John's Janitorial Lakeland Sanitary
Dade City, FL Lakeland, FL
{litem | Quant 1Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost|
1 25{Wasp Spray, Zenkill lil Long Shot, No Substitutions No bid No bid $562.80 $1,320.00
2 5|Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal $47.70 $238.50 $45.60 $228.00]
Brand bid Raid Raid
3 5|Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal $72.31 $361.55 $36.00 $180.00,
Brand bid Lysol original Zenex
4 70}Clorox Green Works, No Substitutions $7.53 $527.10 $5.90 $413.00]
5 53| Toilet Bowi Cleaner, Misty Bolex BL0925 or equal $3.28 $173.84 $2.20 $116.60
Brand bid Theochem Laketand Chemical
6 15|Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal $11.71 $175.65 $5.90 $88.501
Brand bid Windex Lakeland Glass Cinr:
7 6|Clear plastic cups, Boardwatk BWKYEO9 or equal $54.94 $329.64 $52.50 $315.00|
Brand bid Dart BWKYEQ9
8 28| Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case No bid No bid $31.76 $889,00]
Brand bid Not equivalent
S 32| Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mill, black 250 per case No bid No bid $21.50 $688.00
Brand bid Not equivalent
10 151]Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case $24.20 $3,654.20 $32.75 $4,945.25¢
Brand bid Penny Lane Not equivaient
11 54| Paper towels, white, multifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal $21.50 $1,161.00 $22.50 $1,215.00
Brand bid BWK 6200 Heavenly Soft
12 100{Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal $29.04 $2,904.00 $19.80 $1,980.00
Brand bid Tork Green Source
13 22| Paper towels, Wypalix60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions $85.63 $1,883.86 $79.50 $1,749.00
14 50{ Toilet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal $34.06 $1,703.00 $37.50 $1,875.00
Brand bid APM276GREEN GEN 238
15 118{Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9°, 2-ply, 12 rolls per case $20.46 $2,414.28 $19.75 $2,330.50
Brand bid GEN 202 JRT-9
16 225|Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal No bid No bid No bid No bidj
Brand bid
17 23{Cups, hot/cold coffee, Dart Jeup or equal $23.35 $537.05 $22.75 $523.25
Brand bid DCC12J12 Dart
18 3|Hand sanitary wipes, Wypall 91371, No Substitutions $70.19 $210.57 $69.756 $209.25
19 88| Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
20 18{Cooler, 5-gallon, igloo, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid
21 10]Cooler, 2-gallon, Igloo, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid
22 12{Hand soap, heavy duty cleaner, Tropic Orange or equal $24.01 $288.12 $17.50 $210.00,
Brand bid GQJO Dab-49
23 10{Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions $23.13 $231.30 $25.50 $255.00
24 125|Bleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal $3.71 $463.75 $2.58 $322.50
Brand bid CLO02490 Clorox
25 100{ Time mist spray, or equal, 7 oz cans $4.69 $469.00 $4.25 $425.00
Brand bid ™S Time Mist
26 2{Kitchen roll towels, L.-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions $19.94 $39.88 No bid No bidj
*items 8-10 alternate
Delivery TimejWithin 7-14 days Within 2-3 days
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BID NO: RFQ-11-04
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/15/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

6-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Fastenal Company Calico Industries
Auburndale, FL Annapolis Jnctn, MD
litem|Quant :Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost|
1 25{Wasp Spray, Zenkill lif Long Shot, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid}
2 5{Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal $67.33 $336.65 $37.54 $187.70
Brand bid Claire Simoniz
3 5{Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal $110.16 $550.80 $36.44 $182.20
Brand bid Lysol Qriginal Simoniz
4 70iClorox Green Works, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
5 53| Toilet Bowl Cleaner, Misty Bolex BL.0O925 or equal $3.40 $180.20 No bid No bid
Brand bid Multiclean
6 15]Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal $6.35 $95.25 $3.14 $47.10
Brand bid Biosolutions Simoniz
7 6|Clear plastic cups, Boardwalk BWKYE09 or equal $99.00 $594.00 No bid No bid}
Brand bid Lagase-Dart
18 281 Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case $56.90 $1,593.20 $20.21 $565.88
Brand bid Pitt Plastics Calico Industries
3 32{Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mill, black 250 per case $80.85 $2,587.20 $24.24 $775.68
Brand bid Pitt Plastics Calico Industries
10 151{Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case $57.06 $8,616.06 $21.72 $3,279.72
Brand bid Pitt Plastics Calico Industries
11 54| Paper towels, white, multifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal $36.93 $1,994.22 $15.94 $860.76¢
Brand bid Georgia Pacific Putney
12 1001 Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal $33.84 $3,384.00 $15.34 $1,534.00
Brand bid GP Putney
13 22}Paper towels, Wypallx60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions $86.86 $1,910.92 No bid No bid]
14 50{Tollet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal $63.64 $3,182.00 $32.94 $1,647.00
Brand bid GP-Preference Vondrehle
15 118{Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9", 2-ply, 12 rolis per case $56.71 $6,691.78 $24.94 $2,942.92
Brand bid Scott Vondrehie
16 225{ Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal No bid No bid $8.94 $2,011.50
Brand bid A&B
17 23|Cups, hot/cold coffee, Dart Jcup or equal $38.30 $880.80 No bid No bid
Brand bid Dart
18 3|Hand sanitary wipes, Wypall 91371, No Substitutions $82.70 $248.10 No bid No bid
19 88| Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions $62.65 $5,513.20 No bid No bid,
20 18{Cooler, 5-gallon, lgioo, No Substitutions $49.97 $899.46 No bid No bid
21 10|Cooler, 2-gailon, Igioo, No Substitutions $32.62 $326.20 No bid No bid
22 12|Hand soap, heavy duty cleaner, Tropic Orange or equal $13.55 $162.60 No bid No bid
Brand bid G0JO
23 10{Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
24 125(Bleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal $3.83 $478.75 $1.72 $215.00
Brand bid Clorox
25 10C{Time mist spray, or equal, 7 0z cans $4.38 $438.00 No bid No bid
Brand bid Hospeco
26 2]Kitchen roll towels, L-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
Delivery TimelWithin & days Within 5-10 days
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BID NO: RFQ-11-04

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/15/10

Prepared by

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

6-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #11 Bidder #12
Unipak Corp Armchem
Brooklyn, NY Winter Haven, FL
i!tem | Quant ! Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 25{Wasp Spray, Zenkil 1l Long Shot, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bidj
2 §{Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal No bid No bid $57.68 $288.40
Brand bid Raid
3 5| Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal No bid No bid $62.36 $311.80
Brand bid Clorox
4 70|Clorox Green Works, No Substitutions No bid No bid $4.03 $282.10
5 53| Toilet Bowl Cleaner, Misty Bolex BL0925 or equal No bid No bid $2.91 $154.231
Brand bid Misty
6 15| Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal No bid No bid $9.00 $135.00
Brand bid Misty
7 6i{Clear plastic cups, Boardwalk BWKYEQ9 or equal No bid No bid $88.35 $530.10
Brand bid Boardwalk BWKYE-9
1] 28{Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case $23.00 $644.00 $19.95 $558.60
Brand bid UPC
9 32| Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mill, black 250 per case $26.50 $848.00 $19.95 $638.40/
Brand bid UrPC BCX40
10 181|Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case $23.50 $3,548.50 $32.85 $4,960.35
Brand bid UPC BCX60
11 54| Paper towels, white, multifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal No bid No bid $27.18 $1,467.72
Brand bid GEN1509
12 100]|Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal No bid No bid No bid No bidj
Brand bid
13 22|Paper towels, Wypalix60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions No bid No bid $118.16 $2,599.52
14 50| Toilet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal No bid No bid $39.71 $1,885.50
Brand bid GEN238
15 118|Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9", 2-ply, 12 rolls per case No bid No bid $25.00 $2,950.00
Brand bid MER172
16 225 Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal No bid No bid No bid No bidj
Brand bid
17 23{Cups, hot/cold coffee, Dart Joup or equal No bid No bid $35.95 $826.85
Brand bid MSDO12
18 3{Hand sanitary wipes, Wypail 91371, No Substitutions No bid No bid $88.53 $265.59
19 88 Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
20 18{Cooler, 5-gallon, Igloo, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
21 10]Cooler, 2-gallon, lgloo, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
22 12{Hand soap, heavy duty cieaner, Tropic Orange or equal No bid No bid $13.95 $167.40
Brand bid
23 10}Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions No bid No bid $32.60 $326.00%
24 125{Bleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal No bid No bid $2.53 $316.25]
Brand bid BWK Bleach
25 100} Time mist spray, or equal, 7 oz cans No bid No bid $3.32 $332.00
Brand bid
26 2{Kitchen roll towels, L-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
Delivery Time|[Within 1-10 days _
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BID NO: RFQ-11-04 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/15/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
6-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #13 Bidder #14
All American Poly Gem Supply
Piscataway, NJ Lakeland, FL.
{ltem|Quant ;Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost|
1 25{Wasp Spray, Zenkill 1l Long Shot, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bidj
2 5]Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal No bid No bid $45.09 $225.45
Brand bid Triple S

3 5|Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal No bid No bid $37.94 $189.70
Brand bid Spartan

4 70{Clorox Green Works, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid

5 53| Toilet Bowl Cleaner, Misty Bolex BL.0925 or equat No bid No bid $1.73 $91.69
Brand bid Spartan

6 15|Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal No bid No bid $6.07 $91.05)
Brand bid Spartan

7 6|Clear plastic cups, Boardwalk BWKYEQS or equal No bid No bid No bid No bidjl
Brand bid

18 281 Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case $23.27 $651.56 $31.24 $874.72

Brand bid All American Poly Triple §

9 32| Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mill, black 250 per case $26.46 $846.72 No bid No bid
Brand bid All American Poly

10 151 Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case $18.12 $2,736.12 $32.66 $4,931.66
Brand bid All American Poly Triple S

1 54{Paper towels, white, multifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal No bid No bid $18.56 $1,002.24
Brand bid General

12 100|Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal No bid No bid $28.51 No bid
Brand bid General

13 22[Paper towels, Wypallx60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid

14 50} Toilet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal No bid No bid $34.35 $1,717.50
Brand bid General

15 118{Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9", 2-ply, 12 rolls per case No bid No bid $16.34 $1,928.12
Brand bid General

16 225|Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid

17 23]Cups, hot/celd coffee, Dart Jeup or equal No bid No bid $27.43 $630.89
Brand bid Dart

18 3{Hand sanitary wipes, Wypali 91371, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid

19 88| Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid

20 18{Cooler, 5-gailon, Igloo, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid

21 10{Cooler, 2-gallon, Igloo, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid

22 12{Hand soap, heavy duty cleaner, Tropic Orange or equal No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand bid

23 10{Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid

24 125(Bleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal No bid No bid $1.75 $218.75
Brand bid Pure Bright

25 100{Time mist spray, or equal, 7 oz cans No bid No bid $2.92 $292.00;
Brand bid Triple S

26 2iKitchen roli towels, L-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions No bid No bid $20.74 $41.48

Delivery: Time | Within 5-20 days Within 6 days
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BID NO: RFQ-11-04

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 10/15/10

Prepared by

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

6-months Miscellaneous Janitorial Supplies Bidder #15 Bidder #16
Peninsular Paper interboro Packaging
Tampa, FL Montgomery, NY
Item jQuant 1 Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
1 25| Wasp Spray, Zenkili il Long Shot, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
2 5|Roach/Ant Spray, Raid or equal $58.92 $294.60 No bid No bid
Brand bid Theochem
3 5{Disinfectant Spray, Lysol or equal $43.56 $217.80 No bid No bid
Brand bid Theochem
4 70| Ciorox Green Works, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
5 53| Toilet Bowi Cleaner, Misty Bolex BL.O925 or equal $2.12 $112.36 No bid No bid
Brand bid Theochem
6 15| Glass Cleaner, Windex or equal $3.70 $55.50 No bid No bid
Brand bid Theochem
7 8|Clear plastic cups, Boardwalk BWKYEQ9 or equal $47.60 $285.60 No bid No bid
Brand bid Fabrikal RK9
8 28| Trash liners, small, 24x32, 1 mil, black, 500 per case No bid No bid
Brand bid
9 32{Trash liners, medium, 33x39, 2 mili, black 250 per case No bid No bi
Brand bid
10 151|Trash liners, large, 38x58, 2 mil, black, 100 per case $30.50 $4,605.50
Brand bid Webster
11 54| Paper towels, white, muitifold, Boardwalk BWK6200 or equal $20.15 $1,088.10
Brand bid Cascade
12 100} Paper towels, Hard Roll, Tork Universal RK350A or equal $19.31 $1,931.00 No bid No bid
Brand bid Cascade
13 22| Paper towels, Wypallx60 34790 teri wipes, No Substitutions $77.50 $1.705.00 No bid No bid
14 50| Tollet paper, Green Heritage #276 or equal $32.08 $1,604.00 No bid No bid
Brand bid Cascade
15 118|Toilet paper, Jumbo JRT 9", 2-ply, 12 rolls per case $19.36 $2,284.48 No bid No bid
Brand bid Atlas
16 225{Wiping rags, white, Unisource Quality Wiping cloths or equal $22.20 $4,995,00 No bid No bid
Brand bid Hospeco
17 23| Cups, hot/cold coffee, Dart Jeup or equat $22.25 $511.75 No bid No bid
Brand bid Dart
18 3{Hand sanitary wipes, Wypall 91371, No Substitutions $38.40 $115.20 No bid No bid
19 88} Gatorade 40-8.5 oz, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
20 18]Cooler, 5-galion, lgloo, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
21 10{Cooler, 2-galion, lgico, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid|
22 12{Hand soap, heavy duty cleaner, Tropic Orange or equal $14.88 $178.56 No bid No bid
Brand bid GOJO
23 10{Hand soap, Soft Soap, anti-bacterial, 7.50z, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
24 125iBleach, 96 oz, Clorox or equal $1.63 $203.75 No bid No bid
Brand bid Austin
25 100} Time mist spray, or equal, 7 oz cans $3.10 $310.00 No bid No bid
Brand bid Hospeco
26 2iKitchen roli towels, L-Soft KT-Green, No Substitutions No bid No bid No bid No bid
Delivery Time]Within 7 days Within 7 days
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