BID NO: RFQ-10-63

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #1 Bidder #2
Est National Tool Supply On Site Safety Prod.
Yearly Hollywood, FL. Winter Haven, FL
fltem |Quant 1Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Gloves
1 450]Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL $6.95 $3,127.50 $5.50 $2,475.00
Brand/Bid Liberty Glove & Safety
2 900|Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff $1.25 $1,125.00 $1.25 $1,125.00
Brand/Bid Liberty Glove & Safety
3 340]|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large $1.58 $537.20 $1.80 $612.00
Brand/Bid Liberty Glove & Safety
4| 1000{Brown knit jersey $0.42 $420.00 $0.50 $500.00
Brand/Bid Liberty Glove & Safety
Total, Items 1-4 $5,209.70 $4,712.00
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium $12.50 $625.00 No bid No bid
6 82{Large $12.50 $1,025.00 No bid No bid
7 82| X-large $12.50 $1,025.00 No bid No bid
8 10§2X $12.50 $125.00 No bid No bid
9 10}4X $12.50 $125.00 No bid No bid
10 10}5X $12.00 $120.00 No bid No bid
Brand/Bid DK-1 Maint Co
Total, ltems 5-10 $3,045.00 No bid
Batteries, alkaline only
11 300{AA $0.42 $126.00 $0.40 $120.00
12| 1300[{AAA $0.42 $546.00 $0.45 $585.00
13 800iC $0.69 $552.00 $0.70 $560.00
14 800{D $0.89 $712.00 $0.82 $656.00
15 50019 volt $1.30 $650.00 $1.32 $660.00
16 1006 volt with spring $7.95 $795.00 $21.00 $2,100.00
Brand/Bid Rayovac
Total, ltems 11-16 $3,381.00 $4,681.00
Back support / brace
17 12{Medium  30--34 $6.50 $78.00 $7.27 $87.24
18 12]Large 34--38 $6.50 $78.00 $7.27 $87.24
19 12]XL 38--42 $6.50 $78.00 $7.27 $87.24
20 12]3X 42--52 $6.50 $78.00 $7.27 $87.24
Brand/Bid Liberty Glove & Safety $312.00 $348.96
Total, ltems 17-20
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #1 Bidder #2
Est National Tool Supply On Site Safety Prod.
Yearly Hollywood, FL Winter Haven, FL
flitem |Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12{Moldex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal $18.95 $227.40 $19.78 $237.36
Brand/Bid Gateway Safety
Gloves:
22 125|SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL $11.95 $1,493.75 $10.87 $1,358.75
23 125|SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL $11.95 $10.87 $1,358.75
24 100{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED , $3.00 $300.00
25 150|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG $3.55 $532.50
26 350{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 Xr $3.55 $1,242.50
**bid alternate brand Items 2426
Total, ltems 22-26 $4,792.50
Safety Glasses:
27 144{Smith & Wesson, clear $4.99 $718.56 $5.85 $842.40,
28 350{Pyramex, safety glasses zone 11, smoke $3.99 $1,396.50 $5.56 $1,946.00
Total, ltems 27-28 $2,115.06 $2,788.40
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 24{SIZE 8 $29.95 $718.80 $12.92 $310.08
30 60{SIZE 9 $29.95 $1,797.00 $12.92 $775.20
31 60|SIZE 10 $29.95 $1,797.00 $12.92 $775.20
32 60|SIZE 11 $29.95 $1,797.00 $12.92 $775.20
33 60|SIZE 12 $29.95 $1,797.00 $12.92 $775.20
34 48{SIZE 13 $29.95 $1,437.60 $12.92 $620.16
35 48{SIZE 14 $29.95 $1,437.60 $12.92 $620.16
Total, ltems 28-35 $10,782.00 $4,651.20
Hard Hat:
36 30{Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET $14.95 $448.50 $14.89 $446.70
Respirators, full face:
37 12|3M 6900 Respirator, large $84.95 $1,019.40 $115.00 $1,380.00
38 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium $84.95 $1,019.40 $115.00 $1,380.00
39 12{3M 6700 Respirator, small $84.95 $1,019.40 $115.00 $1,380.00
Total, ltems 37-39 $3,058.20 $4,140.00
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #1 Bidder #2
Est National Tool Supply On Site Safety Prod.
Yearly Hollywood, FL Winter Haven, FL
ltem [Quant |Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8{Medium 550030M $13.95 $111.60 $10.75 $86.00
41 8|Large  550030L $13.95 $111.60 $10.75 $86.00
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 24{3M60932 $10.94 $262.56 $18.31 $439.44,
Respirator filter, half face:
43 7217580P100, North, 2PC filters $8.99 $647.28 $6.00 $432.00]
Total, ltems 40-43 $1,133.04 $1,043.44
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:
44 12{Small $9.95 $119.40 No bid No bid
45 12{Medium $9.95 $119.40 $5.04 $60.48
46 12|Large $9.95 $119.40 $4.59 $55.08
47 12|X-Large $9.95 $119.40 $4.59 $55.08
48 12]12X $9.95 $119.40 $4.80 $57.60]
49 5{3X $9.95 $49.75 $5.01 $25.05
50 514X $9.95 $49.75 $5.25 $26.25
51 5{5X $9.95 $49.75 $5.75 $28.75
Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand:
52 12|Small $11.95 $143.40 $6.50 $78.00
53 12|Medium $11.95 $143.40 $6.50 $78.00
54 12|Large $11.95 $143.40 $6.50 $78.00
55 12|X-Large $11.95 $143.40 $6.50 $78.00
56 12]2X $11.95 $143.40 $6.50 $78.00
57 513X $11.95 $59.75 $6.60 $33.00
58 5|4X $11.95 $59.75 $6.90 $34.50
59 515X $11.95 $59.75 $7.10 $35.50
Total, items 44-59 $1,642.50 Incomplete
Cooler, Igloo brand:
60 35{5 GALLON $34.95 $1,223.25 $37.16 $1,300.60
61 2512 GALLON $31.95 $798.75 $26.00 $650.00
Total, ltems 60-61 $2,022.00 $1,950.60
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #3 Bidder #4
Est Safety Products Conney Safety
Yearly Lakeland, FL Madison, Wi
fltem |Quant iDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Gloves
1 450]Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL $4.00 $1,800.00 $4.82 $2,169.00
Brand/Bid Liberty Direct Safety #128457
2 900|Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff $0.83 $747.00 $1.03 $927.00
Brand/Bid Pip Cordova #13652
3 340|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large $1.23 $418.20 $0.93 $316.20
Brand/Bid West Cordova #24202
4 1000|Brown knit jersey $0.43 $430.00 $0.27 $270.00
Brand/Bid Pip Cordova #10836
Total, items 1-4 $3,395.20 $3,682.20
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium $8.12 $406.00 $9.00 $450.00
6 82ilLarge $8.12 $665.84 $9.00 $738.00
7 82| X-large $8.12 $665.84 $9.00 $738.00
8 10)2X $8.12 $81.20 $9.00 $90.00
9 10}4X $8.12 $81.20 $9.00 $90.00
10 105X $8.12 $81.20 $9.00 $90.00
Brand/Bid Radians Basic Issue
Total, items 5-10 $1,981.28 ***gizes combined $2,196.00
Batteries, alkaline only
11 300|AA $0.22 $66.00 $0.34 $102.00
12}  1300jAAA $0.23 $299.00 $0.38 $494.00
13 800{C $0.49 $392.00 $0.67 $536.00
14 800D $0.62 $496.00 $0.74 $592.00
15 500{9 voit $0.93 $465.00 $1.42 $710.00
16 100{6 volt with spring $1.43 $143.00 $9.78 $978.00
Brand/Bid Rayovac Rayovac
Total, items 11-16 $1,861.00 $3,412.00
Back support / brace
17 12|Medium  30--34 $4.53 $54.36 $7.03 $84.36
18 12|Large 34--38 $4.53 $54.36 $7.03 $84.36
19 12{XL 38--42 $4.53 $54.36 $7.03 $84.36
20 12{3X 42--52 $4.53 $54.36 $7.03 $84.36|
Brand/Bid Liberty Durawear $217.44|Direct Safety $337.44
Total, ltems 17-20
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #3 Bidder #4
Est Safety Products Conney Safety
Yearly Lakeland, FL Madison, Wi
fltem {Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12{Moldex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal $16.70 $200.40 $17.96 $215.52
Brand/Bid Moldex Moldex
Gloves:
22 125{SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL No bid No bid $8.18 $1,022.50
23 125|SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL No bid No bid $8.18 $1,022.50
24 100{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED $2.52 $252.00 $4.72 $472.00
25 150{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG $2.52 $378.00 $4.72 $708.00
26 350|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 XL $2.52 $882.00 $5.00 $1,750.00
Total, items 22-26 Incomplete $4,975.00
Safety Glasses:
27 144{Smith & Wesson, clear $4.59 $660.96 $4.94 $711.36
28 350{Pyramex, safety giasses zone 11, smoke No bid No bid $2.93 $1,025.50
Total, ltems 27-28 Incomplete $1,736.86
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 24(SIZE 8 $10.38 $249.12 $11.69 $280.56
30 60|SIZE 9 $10.38 $622.80 $11.69 $701.40
3 60|SIZE 10 $10.38 $622.80 $11.69 $701.40
32 60{SIZE 11 $10.38 $622.80 $11.69 $701.40
33 60|SIZE 12 $10.38 $622.80 $11.69 $701.40
34 48{SIZE 13 $10.38 $498.24 $11.69 $561.12
35 481SIZE 14 $10.38 $498.24 $11.69 $561.12
Total, Items 29-35 $3,736.80 $4,208.40
Hard Hat:
36 30{Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET $11.45 $343.50 $12.16 $364.80
Respirators, full face:
37 1213M 6900 Respirator, large $90.83 $1,089.96 $97.64 $1,171.68
38 12]3M 6800 Respirator, medium $90.83 $1,089.96 $97.64 $1,171.68
39 12{3M 6700 Respirator, small $90.83 $1,089.96 $97.64 $1,171.68
Total, tems 37-39 $3,269.88 $3,515.04
o
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #3 Bidder #4
Est Safety Products Conney Safety
Yearly Lakeland, FL Madison, Wi
fltem }Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8|Medium 550030M $7.25 $58.00 $9.25 $74.00,
41 8llarge  550030L $7.25 $58.00 $9.25 $74.00
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 243M60932 $14.90 $357.60 $16.00 $384.00
Respirator filter, halif face:
43 72{7580P100, North, 2PC filters $4.90 $352.80 $5.26 $378.72
Total, ltems 40-43 $826.40 $910.72
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:
44 12|Small $3.56 $42.72 $4.39 $52.68
45 12|Medium $3.56 $42.72 $4.39 $52.68
46 12{Large $3.56 $42.72 $4.39 $52.68
47 12|X-Large $3.56 $42.72 $4.39 $52.68
48 12]2X $3.74 $44.88 $4.60 $55.20
49 5{3X $3.93 $19.65 $4.84 $24.20
50 514X $4.09 $20.45 $5.08 $25.40
51 515X $4.28 $21.40 $5.30 $26.50
Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand:
52 12|Smali $4.80 $57.60 $5.46 $65.52
53 12|Medium $4.80 $57.60 $5.46 $65.52
54 12}Large $4.80 $57.60 $5.46 $65.52
55 12|X-Large $4.80 $57.60 $5.46 $65.52
56 12]2X $4.91 $58.92 $5.74 $68.88
57 513X $5.13 $25.65 $6.07 $30.35
58 5[4X $5.35 $26.75 $6.39 $31.95
59 5/5X $5.55 $27.75 $6.65 $33.25
Total, ltems 44-59 $646.73 $768.53
Cooler, igloo brand:
60 35{5 GALLON $30.23 $1,058.05 $38.64 $1,352.40
61 25{2 GALLON $22.19 $554.75 $23.80 $595.00
Total, items 60-61 $1,612.80 $1,947.40
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/08/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #5 Bidder #6
Est Goodwill Industries ProPac, Inc.
Yearly Wichita, KS N. Charleston, SC
Hitem [Quant iDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Gloves
1 450|Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL No bid No bid $5.50 $2,475.00
Brand/Bid Amercare
2 900|Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff No bid No bid $1.00 $900.00,
Brand/Bid ProPac, Inc.
3 340|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large No bid No bid $1.40 $476.00
Brand/Bid Westchester
41 1000{Brown knit jersey No bid No bid $0.35 $350.00
Brand/Bid Westchester
Total, items 1-4 No bid $4,201.00
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium $23.25 $1,162.50 $13.00 $650.00
6 82jLarge $24.25 $1,988.50 $13.00 $1,066.00
7 82| X-large $24.25 $1,988.50 $13.00 $1,066.00
8 1042X $25.50 $255.00 $13.00 $130.00
9 10(4X $25.50 $255.00 $13.00 $130.00
10 105X $26.75 $267.50 $13.00 $130.00
Brand/Bid Goodwill industries Ergodyne
Total, ltems 5-10 $5,917.00{ $3,172.00
Batteries, alkaline only
11 300]AA No bid No bid $0.35 $105.00
121 1300jAAA No bid No bid $0.40 $520.00
13 800|C No bid No bid $1.10 $880.00
14 800D No bid No bid $0.50 $400.00
15 500]9 volt No bid No bid $1.25 $625.00
16 100{6 volt with spring No bid No bid $9.00 $900.00
Brand/Bid various
Total, ltems 11-16 No bid $3,430.00
Back support / brace
17 12{Medium  30--34 No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00
18 12{Large 34--38 No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00
19 12{XL 38--42 No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00
20 123X 42--52 No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00
Brand/Bid No bid|DK-1 $336.00
Total, ltems 17-20
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING; 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #5 Bidder #6
Est Goodwill Industries ProPac, Inc.
Yearly Wichita, KS N. Charleston, SC
fitem |Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12{Moldex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal No bid No bid $26.00 $312.00
Brand/Bid Moldex
Gloves:
22 125|SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL No bid No bid $10.75 $1,343.75
23 125{SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL No bid No bid $10.75 $1,343.75
24 100{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED No bid No bid No bid No bid
25 150{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG No bid No bid No bid No bid
26 350{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 XL No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, ltems 22-26 No bid No bid
Safety Glasses:
27 144]|Smith & Wesson, clear No bid No bid No bid No bid
28 350|Pyramex, safety glasses zone 11, smoke No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, ltems 27-28 No bid No bid
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 24|SIZE 8 No bid No bid No bid No bid
30 60{SIZE 9 No bid No bid No bid No bid
31 60|SIZE 10 No bid No bid No bid No bid
32 60SIZE 11 No bid No bid No bid No bid
33 60|SIZE 12 No bid No bid No bid No bid
34 48{SIZE 13 No bid No bid No bid No bid
35 481SIZE 14 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, Items 29-35 No bid No bid
Hard Hat:
36 30|Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirators, full face:

37 12]3M 6900 Respirator, large No bid No bid $120.00 $1,440.00
38 12]3M 6800 Respirator, medium No bid No bid $120.00 $1,440.00
39 12|3M 6700 Respirator, small No bid No bid $125.00 $1,500.00
Total, ltems 37-39 No bid $4,380.00




BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #5 Bidder #6
Est Goodwill Industries ProPac, Inc.
Yearly Wichita, KS N. Charleston, SC
iitem |Quant |Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8{Medium 550030M No bid No bid $6.00 $48.00
41 8iLarge 550030L No bid No bid $12.00 $96.00
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 2413M60932 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirator filter, half face:
43 72|7580P100, North, 2PC filters No bid No bid $6.75 $486.00
Total, items 40-43 No bid Incomplete
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:
44 12|Small No bid No bid No bid No bid
45 12{Medium No bid No bid No bid No bid
46 12|Large No bid No bid No bid No bid
47 12|X-Large No bid No bid No bid No bid
48 12]2X No bid No bid No bid No bid
49 513X No bid No bid No bid No bid
50 5]4X No bid No bid No bid No bid
51 5[5X No bid No bid No bid No bid
Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand:
52 12{Small No bid No bid No bid No bid
53 12|Medium No bid No bid No bid No bid
54 12{Large No bid No bid No bid No bid
55 12|X-Large No bid No bid No bid No bid
56 1212X No bid No bid No bid No bid
57 5/3X No bid No bid No bid No bid
58 5|4X No bid No bid No bid No bid
59 5/5X No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, items 44-59 No bid No bid
Cooler, igloo brand:

60 35{5 GALLON No bid No bid $42.00 $1,470.00
61 25|12 GALLON No bid No bid $29.00 $725.00
Total, ltems 60-61 No bid $2,195.00
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #7 Bidder #8
Est Pyramid School Prod MSC Industrial Supply
Yearly Tampa, FL Clearwater, FL
fltem |Quant iDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Gloves
1 450{Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL $4.89 $2,200.50 $4.50 $2,025.00
Brand/Bid Tralex 1X6200 Prosafe
2 900|Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff No bid No bid $0.84 $756.00
Brand/Bid Prosafe
3|  340|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large No bid No bid $2.00 $680.00
Brand/Bid Best
4{ 1000|Brown knit jersey No bid No bid $0.40 $400.00
Brand/Bid Prosafe
Total, Items 1-4 Incomplete $3,861.00
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium No bid No bid No bid No bid
6 82iLarge No bid No bid No bid No bid
7 82|X-large No bid No bid No bid No bid
8 1012X No bid No bid No bid No bid
9 10{4X No bid No bid No bid No bid
10 10]5X No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
Total, ltems 5-10 No bid No bid
Batteries, alkaline only
11 300]AA $0.30 $90.00 $0.25 $75.00
12]  1300{AAA $0.31 $403.00 $0.25 $325.00
13 800{C $0.49 $392.00 $0.54 $432.00
14 800D $0.61 $488.00 $0.71 $568.00
15 500{9 volt $0.92 $460.00 $0.91 $455.00
16 100j6 volt with spring $5.89 $589.00 $7.50 $750.00
Brand/Bid Rayovac Energizer
Total, Items 11-16 $2,422.00 $2,605.00
Back support / brace
17 12]Medium  30--34 No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00
18 12{Large 34--38 No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00
19 12]XL 38--42 No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00
20 12|3X 42--52 No bid No bid|. )
Brand/Bid No bid|Prosafe $336.00
Total, ltems 17-20
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #7 Bidder #8
Est Pyramid School Prod MSC Industrial Supply
Yearly Tampa, FL Clearwater, FL
fitem JQuant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12|Moldex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal No bid No bid $19.00 $228.00}
Brand/Bid Moldex
Gloves:
22 125{SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL No bid No bid No bid No bid
23 125|SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL No bid No bid No bid No bid
24 100{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED No bid No bid No bid No bid
25 150]Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG No bid No bid No bid No bid
26 350{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 XL No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, ltems 22-26 No bid No bid
Safety Glasses:
27 144|Smith & Wesson, clear No bid No bid No bid No bid
28 350]|Pyramex, safety glasses zone 11, smoke No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, ltems 27-28 No bid No bid
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 241SIZE 8 No bid No bid $12.00 $288.00
30 60|SIZE 9 No bid No bid $12.00 $720.00
31 60{SIZE 10 No bid No bid $12.00 $720.00
32 60|SIZE 11 No bid No bid $12.00 $720.00
33 60|SIZE 12 No bid No bid $12.00 $720.00
34 48|SIZE 13 No bid No bid $12.00 $576.00
35 48iSIZE 14 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, items 29-35 No bid incomplete
Hard Hat:
36 30|Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET No bid No bid $12.00 $360.00
Respirators, full face:
37 12]3M 6900 Respirator, large No bid No bid $99.90 $1,198.80,
38 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium No bid No bid $105.00 $1,260.00
39 12]|3M 6700 Respirator, smail No bid No bid $99.90 $1,198.80
Total, Items 37-39 No bid $3,657.60
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/08/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #7 Bidder #8
Est Pyramid School Prod MSC Industrial Supply
Yearly Tampa, FL Clearwater, FL
fitem {Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8|Medium 550030M No bid No bid $7.00 $56.00
41 8lLarge  550030L No bid No bid $7.00 $56.00
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 2413M60932 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirator filter, half face:
43 72}7580P100, North, 2PC filters No bid No bid $4.50 $324.00
Total, ltems 40-43 No bid Incomplete
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:
44 12|Small No bid No bid $5.00 $60.00
45 12{Medium No bid No bid $5.00 $60.00
46 12|Large No bid No bid $5.00 $60.00
47 12|X-Large No bid No bid $5.00 $60.00
48 12)2X No bid No bid $5.00 $60.00
49 5[3X No bid No bid No bid No bid
50 5(4X No bid No bid No bid No bid
51 5|5X No bid No bid No bid No bid
Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand:
52 12{Small No bid No bid No bid No bid
53 12|Medium No bid No bid $6.00 $72.00
54 12|Large No bid No bid $6.00 $72.00
55 12|X-Large No bid No bid $6.00 $72.00
56 12]2X No bid No bid $6.00 $72.00
57 513X No bid No bid No bid No bid
58 514X No bid No bid No bid No bid
59 5{5X No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, Items 44-59 No bid Incomplete
Cooler, Igioo brand:

60 3515 GALLON $29.98 $1,049.30 $30.00 $1,050.00,
61 25{2 GALLON $15.98 $399.50 $19.00 $475.00
Total, items 60-61 $1,448.80 $1,525.00
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BID NO: RFQ-10-83 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Est Henry Schein, Inc. Safety Zone
Yearly Melville, NY Lakeland, FL
fltiem |Quant iDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Gloves
1 450]Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL $5.42 $2,439.00 No bid No bid
Brand/Bid Schein
2 900{Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
3 340|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
41 1000|Brown knit jersey No bid No bid $0.68 $680.001
Brand/Bid
Total, items 1-4 No bid Incomplete
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium No bid No bid $11.50 $575.00,
6 82{Large No bid No bid $11.50 $943.00
7 82| X-large No bid No bid $11.50 $943.00
8 10{2X No bid No bid $11.50 $115.00
9 104X No bid No bid $11.50 $115.008
10 10§5X No bid No bid $11.50 $115.00
Brand/Bid Pip
Total, ltems 5-10 No bid $2,806.00
Batteries, alkaline only
11 300]AA 0.286 $85.80 $0.21 $63.00
12} 1300{AAA 0.2892692 $376.05 $0.22 $286.00
13 800{C 0.577875 $462.30 $0.47 $376.00
14 800|D 0.778875 $623.10 $0.69 $552.00
156 500{9 volt - 0.6426 $321.30 $0.78 $390.00
16 100|6 volt with spring No bid No bid $1.54 $154.00
Brand/Bid Eveready Rayovac
Total, ltems 11-16 Incomplete $1,821.00
Back support / brace
17 12{Medium  30--34 $25.09 $301.08 $10.60 $127.20
18 12{Large 34--38 $25.09 $301.08 $10.90 $130.80
19 12]XL 38--42 $25.09 $301.08 $10.90 $130.80
20 123X 42--52 No bid No bid $10.90 $130.80
Brand/Bid Pro Orthopedic Incomplete|Erb $519.60
Total, ltems 17-20
g g
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Est Henry Schein, Inc. Safety Zone Specialists
Yearly Melville, NY Lakeland, FL
fitem |Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12|Moidex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal $20.41 $244.92 $43.50 $522.00
Brand/Bid Moldex Erb (200 per box)
Gloves:
22 125{SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL $7.59 $948.75 No bid No bid
23 125/SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL $7.59 $948.75 No bid No bid
24 100|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED No bid No bid No bid No bid
25 150{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG No bid No bid No bid No bid
26 350{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 XL No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, Items 22-26 Incomplete No bid
Safety Glasses:
27 144|Smith & Wesson, clear No bid No bid No bid No bid
28 350|Pyramex, safety glasses zone 11, smoke No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, ltems 27-28 No bid No bid
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 24{SIZE 8 No bid No bid No bid No bid
30 60{SIZE 9 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Ky 60{SIZE 10 No bid No bid No bid No bid
32 60{SIZE 11 No bid No bid No bid No bid
33 60{SIZE 12 No bid No bid No bid No bid
34 481SIZE 13 No bid No bid No bid No bid
35 48{SIZE 14 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, items 29-35 Incomplete No bid
Hard Hat:
36 30{Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirators, full face:

37 12|3M 6900 Respirator, large No bid No bid No bid No bid
38 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium No bid No bid No bid No bid
39 12|3M 6700 Respirator, small No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, items 37-39 No bid No bid
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #9 Bidder #10
Est Henry Schein, Inc. Safety Zone Specialists
Yearly Melville, NY Lakeland, FL
fitem |Quant |Description Unit Cost Total Cost : Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8|Medium 550030M No bid No bid No bid No bid
41 8lLarge  550030L No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 2413M60932 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirator filter, half face:
43 72|7580P100, North, 2PC filters No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, ltems 40-43 No bid No bid
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:
44 12{Small No bid No bid No bid No bid
45 12{Medium No bid No bid No bid No bid
46 12|Large No bid No bid No bid No bid
47 12|X-Large . No bid No bid No bid No bid
48 12§2X No bid No bid No bid No bid
49 513X No bid No bid No bid No bid
50 514X No bid No bid No bid No bid
51 515X No bid No bid No bid No bid
Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand:
52 12{Smali No bid No bid No bid No bid
53 12{Medium No bid No bid No bid No bid
54 12|Large No bid No bid No bid ) No bid
55 12|X-Large No bid No bid No bid No bid
56 12j2X No bid No bid No bid No bid
57 5(3X No bid No bid No bid No bid
58 514X No bid No bid No bid No bid
59 515X No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, items 44-59 No bid No bid
Cooler, Igloo brand:

60 35(5 GALLON $31.88 $1,115.80 No bid No bid
61 25|12 GALLON $30.25 $756.25 No bid No bid
Total, items 60-61 $1,872.05 No bid

"
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #11 Bidder #12
Est Saf-T-Glove, Inc. E & W Tool & Supply
Yearly Grand Prairie, TX Mulberry, FL
fitem |Quant iDescription Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Gloves
1 450{Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL $4.84 $2,178.00 $4.55 $2,047.50
Brand/Bid Saf T Glove Seattle Glove
2 900} Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff $1.04 $936.00 $0.85 $765.00
Brand/Bid Saf T Glove Seattle Glove
3 340|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large $2.16 $734.40 $1.38 $469.20
Brand/Bid Saf T Glove Seattle Glove
4] 1000|Brown knit jersey $0.29 $290.00 $0.27 $270.00
Brand/Bid Saf T Glove Seattle Glove
Total, items 1-4 $4,138.40 $3,551.70
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium $7.85 $392.50 $9.35 $467.50
6 82iLarge $7.85 $643.70 $9.35 $766.70
7 82(X-large $7.85 $643.70 $9.35 $766.70,
8 10j2X $7.85 $78.50 $9.35 $93.50
9 10}4X $7.85 $78.50 $10.26 $102.60
10 10|5X $7.85 $78.50 No bid No bid
Brand/Bid Cordova MCR Safety
Total, items 5-10 . $1,915.40 Incomplete
.Batteries, alkaline only
11 3001AA $0.57 $171.00 $0.35 $105.00
121 1300jAAA $0.57 $741.00 $0.35 : $455.00
13 800iC $1.16 $928.00 $0.58 $464.00
14 800|D $1.42 $1,136.00 $0.63 $504.00
15 500}9 volt $2.30 $1,150.00 $1.22 $610.00
16 10016 volt with spring $9.41 $941.00 $1.64 $164.00
Brand/Bid Brightstar items 11-15; Rayovac
Duracell ltem 16
Total, items 11-16 $5,067.00 $2,302.00
Back support / brace
17 12{Medium  30--34 $7.09 $85.08 $7.79 $93.48
18 12]Large 34--38 $7.09 $85.08 $7.79 $93.48
19 12|XL 38--42 $7.09 $85.08 $7.79 $93.48
20 12]3X 42--52 $8.36 $100.32 $7.79 $93.48
Brand/Bid Pyramex $355.56{valco $373.92

Total, ltems 17-20
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #11 Bidder #12
Est Saf-T-Glove, Inc. E & W Tool & Supply
Yearly Grand Prairie, TX Mulberry, FL
fitem jQuant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12|Moldex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal $17.76 $213.12 $18.85 $226.20]
Brand/Bid Moldex Moldex
Gloves:
22 125|SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL $7.50 $937.50 $11.58 $1,447.50
23 125[SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL $7.50 $937.50 $11.58 $1,447.50
24 100|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED $2.81 $281.00 $2.60 $260.00
25 150|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG $2.81 $421.50 $2.60 $390.00
26 350|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 XL $3.01 $1,053.50 $2.40 $840.00
Total, ltems 22-26 $3,631.00 $4,385.00
Safety Glasses:
27 144|Smith & Wesson, clear No bid No bid $4.70 $676.80
28 350|Pyramex, safety glasses zone 11, smoke No bid No bid $5.49 $1,921.50
Total, ltems 27-28 No bid $2,598.30
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 24|SIZE 8 No bid No bid $11.69 $280.56
30 60|SIZE 9 No bid No bid $11.69 $701.40
31 60{SIZE 10 No bid No bid $11.69 $701.40
32 60|SIZE 11 No bid No bid $11.69 $701.40
33 60|SIZE 12 No bid No bid $11.69 $701.40
34 48|SIZE 13 No bid No bid $11.69 $561.12
35 48|SIZE 14 No bid No bid $11.69 $561.12
Total, ltems 28-35 No bid $4,208.40
Hard Hat:
36 30{Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET $12.46 $373.80 $10.40 $312.00
Respirators, full face:

37 12|3M 6900 Respirator, large $45.60 $547.20 $92.64 $1,111.68
38 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium $95.60 $1,147.20 $92.64 $1,111.68
39 12|3M 6700 Respirator, small $95.60 $1,147.20 $92.64 $1,111.68
Total, ltems 37-39 $2,841.60 $3,335.04
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #11 Bidder #12
Est Saf-T-Glove, inc. E & W Tool & Supply
Yearly Grand Prairie, TX Mulberry, FL
fitem |Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8|Medium 550030M $17.97 $143.76 $9.25 $74.00
41 8llLarge  550030L $17.97 $143.76 $9.25 $74.00
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 24{3M60932 $6.85 $164.40 $4.73 $113.52
Respirator filter, half face:
43 72{7580P100, North, 2PC filters $5.10 $367.20 $5.44 $391.68
Total, ltems 40-43 $819.12 $653.20
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:
44 12}Small $3.95 $47.40 $4.39 $52.68
45 12{Medium $3.95 $47.40 $4.39 $52.68
46 12]Large $3.95 $47.40 $4.39 $52.68
47 12{X-Large $3.95 $47.40 $4.39 $52.68
48 122X $4.14 $49.68 $4.60 $55.20
49 5|3X $4.34 $21.70 $4.79 $23.95
50 514X $4.54 $22.70 $5.08 $25.40
51 5|5X $4.74 $23.70 $5.35 $26.75
Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand:
52 12{Small $5.02 $60.24 $5.48 $65.76
53 12{Medium $5.02 $60.24 $5.48 $65.76
54 12{Large $5.02 $60.24 $5.48 $65.76
55 12{X-Large $5.02 $60.24 $5.48 $65.76
56 12§2X $5.27 $63.24 $5.75 $69.00
57 513X $5.51 $27.55 $6.04 $30.20
58 514X $5.77 $28.85 $6.35 $31.75
59 515X $6.06 $30.30 $6.67 $33.35
Total, ltems 44-59 $698.28 $769.36
Cooler, igloo brand:
60 35|15 GALLON $36.77 $1,286.95 $33.94 $1,187.90
61 25{2 GALLON $24.01 $600.25 $19.20 $480.00
Total, ltems 60-61 $1,887.20 $1,667.90
o
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63
BID OPENING: 2:00

P.M., 09/09/10

CITY OF WINTER HAVEN
TABULATION OF BIDS

AWARDED TO

Date: WNC:N m%&\%

Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #13 Bidder #14
Est Univar USA Inc. Dancer dba Zee Medical
Yearly Orlando, FL Seffner, FL
flliem 1Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Gloves
1 450]Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL $8.00 $3,600.00 $6.25 $2,812.50
Brand/Bid Blue Nitril Glove Cypress #3074
2 900|Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff No bid No bid sold by dozen $1,263.75
Brand/Bid #3106001
3 340|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large $7.16 $2,434.40 sold by dozen $653.95
Brand/Bid Aabaco Memphis #3107
4| 1000|Brown knit jersey No bid No bid sold by dozen $432.60}
Brand/Bid #3102001
Total, Items 1-4 Incomplete $5,162.80
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium No bid No bid $9.95 $497.50
6 82|Large No bid No bid $9.95 $815.90
7 82| X-large No bid No bid $9.95 $815.90
8 10)2X No bid No bid $14.95 $149.50
9 104X No bid No bid $15.95 $159.50
10 10{5X No bid No bid $16.95 $169.50
Brand/Bid River city #vCL35
Total, Items 5-10 No bid $2,607.80
Batteries, alkaline only
11 300|AA No bid No bid No bid No bid
12| 1300]AAA No bid No bid No bid No bid
13 800|C No bid No bid No bid No bid
14 800|D No bid No bid No bid No bid
15 50019 volt No bid No bid No bid No bid
16 10016 volt with spring No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
Total, Items 11-16 No bid No bid
Back support / brace
17 12|Medium  30--34 No bid No bid $15.00 $180.00
18 12jLarge 34--38 No bid No bid $15.00 $180.00
19 12iXL 38--42 No bid No bid $15.00 $180.00
20 123X 42--52 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Brand/Bid Chase Ergonomics
Total, Items 17-20 No bid Incomplete
Prepared by \mw é\\\\ % x%
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #13 Bidder #14
Est Univar USA Inc. Dancer dba Zee Medical
Yearly Orlando, FL Seffner, FL
ltem [Quant {Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12{Moldex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal No bid No bid $27.00 $324.00
Brand/Bid Howard Leight Laser Lite
Gloves:
22 125{SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL No bid No bid No bid No bid
23 125|SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL No bid No bid No bid No bid
24 100{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED $3.19 $319.00 No bid No bid
25 150{Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG $3.19 $478.50 No bid No bid
26 350|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 XL $3.19 $1,116.50 No bid No bid
Total, ltems 22-26 Incomplete No bid
Safety Glasses:
27 144]Smith & Wesson, clear No bid No bid $6.90 $993.60
28 350|Pyramex, safety glasses zone 11, smoke No bid No bid $4.50 $1,575.00
Total, tems 27-28 No bid $2,568.60
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 241SIZE 8 No bid No bid $19.00 $456.00
30 60{SIZE 9 No bid No bid $19.00 $1,140.00
31 60|SIZE 10 No bid No bid $19.00 $1,140.00
32 60|SIZE 11 No bid No bid $19.00 $1,140.00
33 60|SIZE 12 No bid No bid $19.00 $1,140.00
34 48(SIZE 13 No bid No bid $19.00 $912.00
35 481SIZE 14 No bid No bid $19.00 $912.00
Total, ltems 29-35 No bid **bid alternate brand $6,840.00
Hard Hat: Monarch
36 30{Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET No bid No bid $19.50 $585.00
Respirators, full face:
37 12]3M 6900 Respirator, large No bid No bid No bid No bid
38 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium No bid No bid No bid No bid
39 12{3M 6700 Respirator, small No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, Items 37-39 No bid No bid No bid
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO

BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #13 Bidder #14
Est Univar USA Inc. Dancer dba Zee Medical
Yearly Orlando, FL Seffner, FL
fitem |Quant |Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8|Medium 550030M No bid No bid No bid| . No bid
41 8|Large 550030L No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 2413M60932 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Respirator fiiter, haif face:
43 72|7580P100, North, 2PC filters No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, Items 40-43 No bid No bid
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:

44 12{Small No bid No bid $6.50 $78.00

45 12{Medium No bid No bid $6.50 $78.00

46 12|Large No bid No bid $6.50 $78.00

47 12|X-Large No bid No bid $6.50 $78.00

48 12]2X No bid No bid $6.50 $78.00

49 513X No bid No bid $7.50 $37.50

50 514X ) No bid No bid $7.50 $37.50

51 5{5X No bid No bid $7.50 $37.50

Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand;

52 12{Small No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00

53 12|Medium No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00

54 12{Large No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00

55 12{X-Large No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00

56 12]2X No bid No bid $7.00 $84.00

57 513X No bid No bid $8.00 $40.00

58 5|4X No bid No bid $8.00 $40.00

59 515X No bid No bid $8.00 $40.00
Total, ltems 44-59 No bid $1,042.50

Cooler, Igloo brand:

60 35{5 GALLON No bid No bid No bid No bid

61 252 GALLON No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total, Items 60-61 No bid No bid
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #15 Bidder #
Est Armchem International
Yearly Ft Lauderdale, FL
litem [Quant Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Costy
Gloves
1 450{Latex gloves, disposable, powder free, XL $5.53 $2,488.50
Brand/Bid GRPRXL
2 900|Gray shoulder, split leather, palm safety cuff $1.29 $1,161.00
Brand/Bid GLPINBLC
3 340|PVC glove, 14" black, rough finish, Large $1.56 $530.40
Brand/Bid GJDC MN-1
41 1000|Brown knit jersey $0.43 $430.00
Brand/Bid VOL3SC
Total, items 1-4 $4,609.90
Safety vests, Class 3 only, with pockets, lime green color
5 50{Medium No bid No bid
6 82}Large $11.75 $963.50
7 82|X-large $11.75 $963.50
8 102X $11.75 $117.50
9 104X $13.75 $137.50
10 10]5X No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
Total, ltems 5-10 Incomplete
Batteries, alkaline only
11 300{AA No bid No bid
12]  1300jAAA No bid No bid
13 800{C No bid No bid
14 800|D No bid No bid
15 50019 volt No bid No bid
16 10016 volt with spring No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
Total, Items 11-16 No bid
Back support / brace
17 12iMedium  30--34 No bid No bid
18 12{large 34--38 No bid No bid
19 121XL 38--42 No bid No bid
20 12§3X 42--52 No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
Total, items 17-20 No bid
. VA .
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BID NO: RFQ-10-63 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
BID OPENING: 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #15 Bidder #
Est Armchem International
Yearly Ft Lauderdale, FL
fitem |Quant :Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Ear plugs:
21 12{Moldex Spark Plugs #6654, or equal No bid No bid
Brand/Bid
Gloves:
22 125|SUPRENO EC powder free, nitrile exam XL No bid No bid
23 125]SUPRENO EC Powder free, nitrile exam, XXL No bid No bid
24 100|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 MED No bid No bid
25 150]Drivers gloves, Style No-368 LRG No bid No bid
26 350|Drivers gloves, Style No-368 XL No bid No bid
Total, ltems 22-26 No bid
Safety Glasses:
27 144Smith & Wesson, clear No bid No bid
28 350{Pyramex, safety glasses zone 11, smoke No bid No bid
Total, ltems 27-28 No bid
Boots, steel toe, On Guard brand only
29 24{SIZE 8 No bid No bid
30 60{SIZE 9 No bid No bid
31 60{SIZE 10 No bid No bid
32 60[SIZE 11 No bid No bid
33 60{SIZE 12 No bid No bid
34 481SIZE 13 No bid No bid
35 48|SIZE 14 No bid No bid
Total, Items 29-35 No bid
Hard Hat:
36 30|Wide brim V-GARD, (white only) 6 PT RATCHET No bid No bid
Respirators, full face:
37 12}3M 6900 Respirator, large No bid No bid
38 12{3M 6800 Respirator, medium No bid No bid
39 12|3M 6700 Respirator, small No bid No bid
Total, items 37-39 No bid
e
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BID NO: RFQ-10-83 CITY OF WINTER HAVEN AWARDED TO
BID OPENING:; 2:00 P.M., 09/09/10 TABULATION OF BIDS
Annual Contract - Misc Safety Supplies Bidder #15 Bidder #
Est Armchem International
Yearly Ft Lauderdale, FL
fitem {Quant |Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost
Respirator, half face, North:
40 8{Medium 550030M No bid No bid
41 8|Large  550030L No bid No bid
Respirator filter, full face, North
42 2413M60932 No bid No bid
Respirator filter, half face:
43 72|7580P100, North, 2PC filters No bid No bid
Total, items 40-43 No bid
Rain Coats, River City, 200 Series brand:
44 12|Small No bid No bid
45 12{Medium No bid No bid
46 12|Large No bid No bid
47 12{X-Large No bid No bid
48 12§2X No bid No bid
49 513X No bid No bid
50 514X No bid No bid
51 5/5X No bid No bid
Rain suits, River City, 200 Series brand:
52 12]Small No bid No bid
53 12|Medium No bid No bid
54 12}Large No bid No bid
55 12|X-Large No bid No bid
56 12§2X No bid No bid
57 513X No bid No bid
58 5]4X No bid No bid
59 5|5X No bid No bid
Total, ltems 44-59 No bid
Cooler, lgloo brand:
60 355 GALLON No bid No bid
61 25|2 GALLON No bid No bid
Total, Items 60-61 No bid
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